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Several years ago a resident of a small Northern 
town kept insisting to a local newspaper reporter that 
a policeman had been shot and killed during a racial 
disturbance there. The reporter checked and rechecked 
but was unable to substantiate the story. In fact a 
policeman had been killed, but in another city. The 
man simply had heard a garbled version of the story 
-not an unusual occurrence in the confusion that 
prevails during crises. 

Crisis situations increase the need for news. During 
most serious disturbances, news media are bombarded 
with calls from anxious citizens wanting information, 
clarification, verification of what they have heard. So 
important is the flow of news through established 
channels that its continued absence can help precipi• 
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MEDIA 
MYTHS 
ON 
VIOLENCE 
A study of media performance reveals 
improvements and a healthy willing­
ness to experiment with new pro­
cedures. But certain shortcomings 
persist. 

tate a crisis. In 1968 in Detroit the absence of newspa• 
pers during a protracted strike helped create a panic: 
there were rumors in the white community that blacks 
were planning to blow up freeways, kill suburban 
white children, and destroy public buildings; in the 
black community, that white vigilantes were coming 
into the area to attack the residents. Gun clubs sprang 
up in the suburbs; black leaders urged preparation of 
survival kits. On March 7-nearly 4 months after the 
strike began-Detroit's Mayor Cavanagh had to go on 
TV to plead for calm. 

As racial disorders have become a familiar part of 
the national scene, the media liave demonstrated a 
growing awareness of their responsibilities and a 
healthy willingness to experiment with new policies 
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and procedures. Technical improvements also have 
been made. The city of Detroit, for example, has built 
a press room large enough for 150 people, with inde­
pendent telephone lines. Operational techniques have 
been modernized. The Pittsburgh police, among others, 
have on occasion provided a helicopter for the press. 
And central headquarters or "press centrals" have 
been established to help eliminate conflicting reports. 
Moreover, a number of cities have adopted or revised 
guidelines for reporting. These guidelines-sometimes 
informal-urge that unnecessary interpretation be 
minimized, rumors be eliminated, unverified state­
ments be avoided, and superlatives and adjectives in 
"scare" headlines be excluded. One set of guidelines 
put the matter simply: "Honest and dispassionate re-
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porting is the best reporting." 
In accordance with these guidelines, newspapers 

have tended to move away from the "shotgun" ap­
proach-the front-page buildup, complete with splashy 
pictures and boxscores of the latest "riot" news. Dra­
matic but meaningless predictions have also largely 
disappeared. In May 1967, U.S. News & World Report 
declared that Newark was "not expecting trouble", 
while Cleveland was voted the city "most likely to ex­
plode again". Cleveland failed to erupt in: 1967, hut 
Newark experienced one of the most massive outbursts 
in our country's history. This kind of journalism is 
much less common today. 

There is also evidence of greater sympathy and sen­
sitivity toward blacks. How far have we come? Con­
sider the following comment from the New York 
Times on July 23, 1919, concerning the violent disor­
der in Washington, D.C.: 

The majority of the negroes {sic) in Washington be­
fore the great u:ar were well behaved . ... More of 
them admitted the superiority of the white race, and 
troubks between the two races were undreamed of. 
Now and then a negro intent on enforcing a civil rights 
law would force his way into a sal,oon or a theatre and 
demand to be treated the same as whites were, but if 
the manager objected he usually-gave in without more 
than a protest. 

These changes represent considerable improvement. 
But serious problems remain. Glaring instances of in­
accuracy, exaggeration, distortion,. misinterpretation, 
and bias have continued at every level-in newspapers 
and newsmagazines large and small, Northern and 
Southern, liberal and conservative. 

The wire services are probably the most underexam­
ined segment of the media, although as much as 90 
percent of the news in some newspapers on a given 
day may come from the wires. An error in a wire 
service report from one city may be repeated in 
hundreds of newspapers and newscasts. In York, Pa., 
in mid-July 1968, for instance, incidents of rock and 
bottle-throwing were reported. Toward the end of the 
disturbance UPI in Harrisburg asked a stringer to get 
something on the situation. A photographer took a 
picture of a motorcyclist with an ammunition belt 
around his waist and a rifle strapped across his back. 
A small object dangled from the rifle. On July 18, 
the picture reached the Nation's press. The Washington 
Post said: 

Armed Rider-Unidentified motorcyclist drives 
through heart of York, Pa., Negro district, which was 

quiet for the first time in six dccys of sporadic 4i.sorders. 
The Baltimore Sun used the same picture and a 

similar caption: 

Quiet, But . . . An unidentified motorcycle rider, 
armed with a rifle and carrying a be'lt of ammunition, 
was among those in the heart of Yark, Pa., Negro dis­
trict last night. The area was quiet for the first time in 
six days. 

The implication of .this photograph was clear: The 
"armed rider" was a sniper. But·since when do ·snipers 
travel openly in daylight completely armed? Also, isn't 
there something incongruous about photographing a 
sniper, presumably "on his way to work", when 
according to the caption the city "was quiet"? 
Actually the "armed rider" was a 16-year old hoy who 
happened to he fond of hunting groundhogs-a skill 
he had learned as a small boy from his father. On July 
16, as was his custom, the young man had put on his 
ammo belt and strapped a rifle across his hack, letting 
a hunting license dangle so that all would know he was 
hunting animals, not people. Off he went on his motor­
cycle headed for the woods, the fields, the groundhogs, 
and the place reserved for him in the Nation's press. 

More recently, an AP man in Dallas filed a story on 
a student takeover at Southern Methodist University. 
The Fort Worth Star-Tekgram in its evening edition 
of May 2, 1969, put the story on the front page and 
gave it a banner headline. 

Dallas (AP)-Black students with some support from 
whites took over the office of the president of Southern 
Methodist University today and swore to remain until 
their demands are met. . . . 

Reports from the scene said from thirty to thirty-five 
students were in control of [President] Tate's office. 

The takeover occurred during a meeting of Tate and 
a campus organization, the Black League of Afro­
American and African College Students. 

The story had one m~jor flaw-it wasn't true. While 
about 35 students had met with the university presi­
dent, they were not "in control" of his office; nor had 
they "swore to remain" until their demands were met. 
No such "takeover" had occurred, Glen Dromgoole, a 
staff writer for the Star-Telegram, later reported what 
really happened. The black students had met with the 
president for more than 5 hours discussing recent de­
mands. The talks were more friendly than hostile (At 
one point hamburgers were brought in.) By the end of 
the meeting, agreement had been reached on most of 
the issues. Apparently the wire service reporter had 
accepted the many rumors of a student takeover. 
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Martin Hayden of the Detroit News has suggested 
"an almost mathematical relationship between the level 
of exaggeration and the distance of news transmis­
sion". Edwin Guthman of the Los Angeles Times 
maintains that the· early wire serv:ice report "is at the 
crux of the news media's problem". However, it is 
more likely that instances of misreporting remain a 
problem at every media level. The Lemherg Center for 
the Study of Violence, in investigating 25 incidents in 
which the news media had alleged sniping, found that, 
along with the wire services, local and nationally 
known newspapers bore a heavy responsibility for im­
precise, distorted, and inaccurate reporting. 

While treatment of racial disorders is generally 
more restrained today, the news media continue to 
overplay the more violent or sensational aspects of a 
story. The central media concern during the disorder 
at Cornell University in April 1969, for example, was 
the emergence of the blacks from the student union. A 
picture of the students carrying rifles and shotguns, 
splashed across the Nation, had a distorting effect on 
public opinion. The New York Times put the picture 
on page 1 and Newsweek used it on its cover the 
following week. Certain facts were largely ignored: 
Prior to the disorder a cross had been burned in front 
of a black women's dormitory; the students had heard 
radio reports that carloads of armed whites were mov­
ing toward the campus; when the students emerged 
from the building their guns weren't loaded. What was 
basically a defensive response by a group of frightened 
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students came across in the media as a terrorist act by 
student guerrillas. 

Aspects of the disorders are dramatic and do merit 
extensive coverage. But the media still tend to equate 

had news with big news and to confuse the obvious 
with the relevant. Thus when 65 students at Brandeis 
University took over a building in 1969, it rated a 
story on the front page of the New York Times. This 
was despite the fact that there was no violence, that 
classes continued, and that the university suffered only 
minor inconvenience. I was on campus then. My only 
recollection of anything unusual was that on the first 
day or two an attendant asked to see my identification, 
and for the next week and a half I noticed large 
numbers of reporters, press cars, cameras, and other 
equipment. I sometimes wondered if there weren't 
more reporters outside than students inside the build­
ing. 

The Times, along with most newspapers, missed the 
unusual climax at Brandeis. In a war of nerves with 
the students, President Morris Abram showed consum­
mate skill in handling the situation, remaining flexible 
on the issues, mobilizing the support of the student 
body and faculty, and, above all, refusing to call the 
police. Eleven days after the crisis had begun the stu­
dents quietly left the building-a dramatic victory for 
the Brandeis community. Yet the students' departure 
merely merited a Times story about three inches long, 
well off the front page. 

Disparities between the headlines and news stories 
are another problem. Often much less occurs in the 
story than the headline would indicate. In 1969, for 
example, some concerned parents in Jacksonville, Fla., 
removed their children from Kirby Smith Junior High 
School after a local radio station had broadcast an 
exaggerated report of a fight between black and white 
students. The school principal later indicated that 
"classes continued and there was no panic". Neverthe­
less, the Miami H eral.d headlined its story on April 
25: MOMS MOB SCHOOL AFTER RIOT 'NEWS'. 
Sometimes no violence occurs in the story, dramatic 
headlines to the contrary. A story, appearing in the 
Boston Globe on May 10, 1969, told of a peqceful rally 
by a small group of students at a local theological 
seminary. According to the Globe, the rally was "brief 
and orderly". But the headline above the story read 
NEWTON CAMPUS ERUPTS. 

The use of the word "riot" presents another problem 
because it has no precise meaning in terms of current 
disorders. Webster's defines a "riot" as a "tumultuous 
disturbance of the public peace by three or more per­
sons assembled together and acting with a common 
intent". The difficulty is that "riots" have become so 
frequent and come in so many sizes and shapes as to 
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render the word meaningless. There is something ludi­
crous about lumping together as "riots" Detroit, with 
43 deaths, 7,000 arrests, and $45 million in property 
damage, and an incident in which three people break a 
few store windows. Yet this is precisely what the news 
media still do. The continued use by the media of the 
term contributes to an emotionally charged climate in 
which the public tends to view every event as an "inci­
dent", every incident as a "disturbance", and every 
disturbance as a "riot". Journalists would do well to 
drop the word from their vocabulary altogether. 

No law says the media have to interpret and not 
simply report the news, but having assumed this re­
sponsibility they have an obligation to make reasona­
ble judgments based on careful analysis. Unfortun­
ately, journalistic attempts in the direction of social 
science research have been rather amateurish, particu­
larly where ·new trends and patterns are concerned. 
The case of the Cleveland "shoot-out" is a good exam­
ple. On July 23, 1968, an intense gun battle broke out 
between the police and a group of black nationalists 
led by Ahmed Evans. Before the disorder was over 
16,400 National Guardsmen had been mobilized, nine 
persons had been killed, and there was property dam­
age estimated at $2.6 million. The Cleveland Press on 
July 24, 1968, compared the violence to guerrilla activ­
ity in Vietnam:-

... it didn't seem to be a Watts, or a Detroit, or a 
Newark. Or even a Hough of two years ago. No, this 
tragic night seemed to be part of a plan. 

A reporter writing in the New York Times of July 
28, 1968, stated: 

It marks perhaps the first documented case in recent 
history of bfuck, armed, and organized violence against 
the police. 

More recent reports have revealed that the "shoot­
out" was something less than a planned uprising and 
!hat the situation was considerably more complicated 
than indicated initially. Unfortunately, following the 
events in Cleveland, disorders in which shots may have 
been fired were immediately suspected :I:iy the press of 
being part of a "wave". A series of errors involving a 
handful of cities became the basis of a myth-that the 
pattern of violence in 1968 had changed from sponta­
neous to premeditated outbreaks. Few of the nationally 
known newspapers and newsmagazines attempted to 
verify sniping reports coming out of the cities and 
over the wire services; few were willing to undertake 
independent investigations; and far too many were 

overly zealous in their assertions of a new "trend" 
based on limited and unconfirmed evidence. Unwit­
tingly or not, the national media had constructed a 
scenario on armed uprisings. 

Although having more time to check and verify 
reports than daily newspapers, the newsmagazines 
were even more vocal in their assertions of a "new 
pattern". On September 13, 1968, Time took note of 
an "ominous trend" and declared that the violence 
"appears to he changing from spontaneous combustion 
of a mob to the premeditated shootouts of a far-out 
few". The story went on to indicate that "many bat­
tles" had begun with "well planned sniping at police". 
Nearly a year later, on June 27, 1969-long after in­
vestigation by a task force of the National Commission 
on the Causes and Prevention of Violence, by the Lem­
berg Center, and by the New York Times ( which 
reversed itself on the Cleveland question) had cast 
serious doubt about premeditated outbreaks in Cleve­
land and elsewhere-Time still was talking about the 
possibilities of a "guerrilla summer". It was also still 
reminding its readers of the time in Cleveland when 
"police were lured into an ambush". Once started, 
myths are difficult to extinguish. 

Misreporting of sniping incidents has continued 
through 1970, involving two of the most dramatic dis­
orders of the year: Augusta, Georgia, where six per­
sons were killed and Jackson State College in Missis­
sippi, where two students lost their lives. At the time of 
the shootings in Augusta, stories circulated to the 
effect that snipers had fired upon the police and fire­
men. Indeed, this became the justification for the unu­
sually strong police response. In the aftermath of the 
violence, however, not one instance of sniper fire was 
documented, while the Augusta fire chief has since 
said that reports of sniper fire were "exaggerated". No 
policemen, firemen, State patrolmen, or National 
Guardsmen were struck by gunfire. Nevertheless, news­
papers-both in and out of State-carried accounts of 
the violence that made it sound as i£ a foll-scale war 
was going on. 

In the case of Jackson State College, it is significant 
that the State's largest newspaper, the Jackson Clar­
ion-Ledger, had its police reporter take charge of the 
coverage. Throughout the disturbance, the Ledger's 
lead stories became a central channel for the police 
point of view, to the exclusion of all others. Uncon­
firmed reports of sniper fire from the students-promi­
nently cited in this newspaper-once again became the 
justification for excessive, brutal' police actions. (In all 

CIVIL filGHTS DIGEST 6 



fairness, both AP and UPI handled the whole story 
much more objectively.) It is noteworthy that the 
President's Commission on Campus Unrest, while una­
ble to determine positively who fired the first shots, 
cast doubt on the police version of events, and strongly 
condemned police actions as an "unreasonable, unjus­
tified over-reaction". 

The most recent myth created by the media involved 
an alleged "shift" in racial disturbances from large to 
small cities. July 25, 1969, a syndicated reporter for the 
News Enterprise Association (NEA) noted: 

The socially sizzling summer has begun-but unlike 
recent history, it seems to be the minor, not the major, 
cities which are sweltering. 

In an article entitled "Riots, 1969 Style", Newsweek 
declared on August 11: 

... the traditional riot scenario is still being played 
out this summer-with one major difference. This sea• 
son the stage has shifted from the major population 
centers to such small and disparate communities as 
Kokomo, Ind., Santa Ana, Calif., Cairo, Ill., Middle­
town, Conn., and Farrell, Pa. 

September 9, 1969, the New York Times captioned a 
pfoture: 

!'lew Riot Pattern: Rioting in Hartford, Conn., last 
week . . . underscored the fact that smaller cities this 
summer have had more racial trouble than the big,. 
ones. 

Similar stories appeared about the same time in 
scores of other newspapers, including the Wall Street 
I ournal, the Baltimore News Americ;an, the Woburn, 
Mass., Times, and the Pittsburgh Press. 

In fact, racial disorders occurring over the past few 
years-not just this past summer-have been concen­
trated in smaller cities. About 75 percent of all out­
breaks recorded in 1968 by the Lemherg Center's Civil 
Disorder Clearinghouse occurred outside the 100 larg­
est cities. For the first 6 months of 1969 and also for 
the summer no appreciable change in the percentage 
was noted. Furthermore;""many of the cities cited as 
prototypes of this latest "new pattern"-Hartford and 
Middletown, Conn., and Cairo, Ill.,-have had dis­
orders in previous years. The difference is that such 
outbreaks were completely overshadowed by a few 
enormous outbreaks in large cities such as Newark and 
Detroit. 

Discovering the origin of these and other myths 
would he useful-a faulty wire service report, an inept 
reporter, an unreliable source. But aside from the fact 
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that such a task would he almost impossible, it would 
miss a central point-that the system of reporting in­
sures that errors of fact and interpretation may he 
repeated, compoundea, and refotmulated as myths. In 
recent years the various components of the media have 
become extremely intertwined and dependent upon one 
another. 

The wire services, the nationally known newspapers, 
and the newsmagazines f~ed one another news and 
information. While the system undoubtedly speeds the 
flow of news to the public, it has encouraged a parrot­
like character in which the various media segments 
tend to reproduce rather than examine one another's 
views. 

In this respect the New York Times' caption pro­
claiming a NEW PATTERN assumes greater signifi­
cance. Prior to its appearance in the Times, I talked 
with Jack Rosenthal, who had been working on a story 
about the relatiyely cool summer. When the subject of 
a new "shift" in violence came up I indicated that 
such allegations were false and misleading. Rosenthal 
wrote a thoughtful story, dwelling on police-commun­
ity relations, civic, programs, and the new community 
spirit among blacks. His story made no mention of a 
"new riot pattern". Apparently the caption writer had 
paid more attention to what Newsweek and the Wall 
Street Journal were saying than to his colleague at the 
Times. 

The failure of the media to tell the complete story in 
the case of Cornell or the right story in the case of 
Cleveland goes beyond a lack of initiative or an incli­
nation to sensationalize. It also indicates a bias-one 
which cuts across political and geographical lines. The 
media are no more aware of this bias than is the 
general public aware of its own. In part, we could call 
it a class bias in that· ,those who comprise media staffs 
.-reporters, editors, headline writers, etc.-are part of 
µie vast American middle class and, as such, express 
its views, values, and standards. 

Both the general public and the media share the 
same dislike of protestors. Both are unable to under­
stand violence as an expression of protest against op­
pressive conditions; both prefer the myth of orderly, 
peaceful change, extolling the virtues of private prop­
erty and public decorum. People are expected to be­
have in a certain way; they just don't go around 
yelling and cursing or throwing rocks. Both will g~ant 
that it took a revolution to secure our independence 
and a civil war to end slavery ( at least officially}, hut 
that was all long ago and somehow different. The bias 
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also has elements of racism in that color is never far 
from the surface. It is difficult to say where the class 
bias begins and racist bias ends. The elements are 
inseparable and reenforce each other, and both mani­
fest themselves in the thinking of the public and media 
alike. 

A growing body of research shows that racial disor­
ders are a part of the social process. The process 
includes an accumulation of grievances, a series of 
tension-heightening incidents such as police harass­
ment, and a precipitating event such as an arrest 
which crystallizes the tensions and grievances that 
have mounted-the "last straw" that triggers the vio­
lence. The "typical rioter" is young, better educated 
than the average inner-city black, and more dissatis­
fied. He wants a better job but feels that prospective 
employers will discriminate against him. He is likely to 
be a long-term resident of the city. (In a survey in 
Detroit, 90 percent of those ·arrested were from De­
troit, 78 percent lived in the State.) He is extremely 
proud of his race and is politically conscious.. He is 

more interested in and informed about politics than 
blacks who are not involved in a disorder. He is also 
more inclined toward political activism. (In one sur­
vey, nearly 40 percent of the participants in the disor­
der, as compared to only about 25 percent of the 
nonparticipants, reported having been involved in 
civil rights activity.) Finally, he receives substantial 
support from the rest of his community, which does 
not participate but regards the violence as necessary 
and beneficial. 

As important as the findings in these studies are, 
they have made virtually no impact on the vast major­
ity of the public. Most Americans continue to believe 
that violence is caused by a tiny and insignificant 
minority; that "outside agitators" and "criminal ele­
ments" are mainly responsible for isolated outbursts 
that have little or no social significance. Intellectuals 
must share a portion of the blame for this situation. 
Having completed their studies, they have been noto­
riously reluctant to roll up their academic shirtsleeves 
and assume leadership in presenting their ideas to the 
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public. There is a trace of condescension in their as­
sumption that good ideas from above will somehow 
trickle down to the "masses of asses", as one academic 
I know calls them. 

Greater responsibility for the failure to confront the 
public's resistance rests with the news media. They 
have failed to commit their power and prestige on 
behalf of such studies. They have failed to place the 
ideas before the public and push for reform in an 
aggressive, effective manner-settling for a splash of 
headlines and stories initially, and little followup. In­
stead the media have opted for the status quo, reflect­
ing, sustaining, and perpetuating outworn beliefs of 
their predominantly white audience. 

Historically the notion of plots and conspiracies has 
always had great currency in this country-and in 
other countries, too. Prior to the Civil War, Southern­
ers frequently viewed abolitionists as "outside agita­
tors" trying to stir up the happy slaves. Violent inter­
racial clashes during World War I were said to have 
been instigated by the Bolsheviks, and the outbreak in 
Detroit in 1913 was attributed to an "Axis plot". The 
current wave of disorders has been blamed on individ­
uals such as Stokely Carmichael and H. Rap Brown or, 
for those who like a more international flavor, "Com­
munist infiltrators". In a survey of six Northern cities 
by the Lemberg Center, 77 percent of ali whites inter­
viewed believed that "outside agitators" were a majQr. 
contributing cause of disorders. When Los Angeles 
Mayor Sam Yorty blamed a rash of school disorders 
on a conspiracy of the Black Student Union, the 
Students for a Democratic Society, Communist sym­
pathizers, and the National Council of Churches, he 
was following a long tradition. 

Such allegations are usually made without a shred 
of evidence, except for an occasional "someone told 
me so". Nevertheless, the media have frequently taken 
their cues from the public in formulating and circulat­
ing such reports. Misinterpretations of the events in 
Cleveland, along with assertions of a "new pattern" of 
premeditated violence, are blatant examples of this 
form of bias. But more often the bias is expressed in 
more subtle ways. For example, when rumors circu­
lated that "outside agitators" were involved in a dis­
turbance in Omaha, Neb., a news story appearing in 
the Arkansas Gazette on June 27, 1969, made reference 
to the rumors but also mentioned that the mayor had no 
evidence to support such reports. Yet, the headline 
above the story read: 'OUTSIDERS' LINKED TO 
OMAHA RIOTING. 

A look at the way in which the disorders are written 
up reveals, tragically, that the majority of the media 
and the public share essentially the same view of the 
violence as meaningless, purposeless, senseless, and ir­
rational. Media treatment of the disorders following 
the assassination of Rev. Martin Luther King, Jr., il­
lustrates the point. The sense of loss and injury among 
blacks at the time of the assassination was extremely 
great, far greater than among whites. The unprece­
dented wave of disorders-approximately 200-was 
expressive of the anger, bitterness, resentment, and 
frustration that black people everywhere felt. 

How did the media handle the disorders? Stories in 
just two newspapers _analyzed-the Buffalo News of 
April 9, 1968 ( the day of Dr. King's funeral), and the 
Trenton Times-Advertiser one day later-are fairly 
typical. No attempt is made to place the violence in a 
social context. The reference to the assassination of 
Dr. King is perfunctory, with only a passing mention 
of his funeral and a few shouts about his death. Val­
ue-laden words receive unusual emphasis. The partici­
pants are "marauders",· not men; they "rove" instead 
of run; they move in "gangs", not groups; they en­
gage in "vandalism", not simply violence. 

We have all grown so used to viewing blacks as 
stereotyped criminals that it is difficult to picture them 
in any other-role; hence such frequent press concoc­
tions as "roving gangs", "roving vandals", "roving 
gangs of rampaging teenagers", or, for variety, "a 
window-smashing rampage of roving gangs of Negro 
youths". The New York Times' assertion on July 1, 
1969, that "roving bands of ruffians" were involved in 
a disturbance in Middletown, Conn., seems somewhat 
feeble by comparison. The effect of such treatment by 
the media is to pander to the public's prejudice, reen­
forcing stereotypes, myths, and other outmoded be­
liefs. The media not only frighten the public but con­
fuse it as well. 

And let us not forget the effects on the news media. 
The proliferation of underground' newspapers, radical 
publications, black journals, as well as underground 
radio statio:qs on FM bands held by churches and 
universities, indicates that the media are failing to' 
reach certain groups; that they still lack sensitivity, 
sophistication, and skepticism commensurate with their 
important and strategic position. 

TERRY ANN KNOPF 

Terry Ann Knopf is a research associate at the Lemberg Center 
/or the Study of Violence, Brandeis University. A slightly di/• 
ferent version of this article first appeared in the Columbia 
Journalism Review, Spring 1970. • 
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SYSTEMS APPROACH TO 
EQUAL OPPORTUNITY 
Much has been said and written on 
where responsibility lies for helping 
solve domestic problems in race rela­
tions and making equal opportunity a 
reality. These problems have been 
studied, stated, restudied, and res­
tated, and yet Government, corpora­
tions, organizations, and various in­
dividuals have not been able to de­
velop long-range goals and plans that 
can he successfully implemented to 
insure equal opportunity. Clearly a 
new direction is required. 

Conversely, massive efforts have 
been successfully undertaken· to pro­
mote the economic growth and devel­
opment of this country, and it seems 
reasonable to question whether we 
can afford to jeopardize such prog­
ress by failing to solve one of our 
most crucial problems, particularly 
when planned interracial communica­
tion and cooperation could lead the 
way toward alleviating its severity. 

The danger for the future is that 
America is going to continue as a 
dual society-white and nonwhite. 
Therefore, it behooves us to realize 
that since this is unlikely tp change 
in the immediate years ahead, inter­
.racial communication must become a 
primary goal. Separatism and polari­
zation are eating away at the founda­
tion of American society. Based on 
these factors, we are in need of un­
derstanding and communication now 

more than at any other period in our 
history. Beyond understanding, active 
cooperation in solving problems is 
also a necessity. Consider the state of 
the Nation in the next decade. 

By 1980, minorities will represent 
approximately 13 percent of the Na­
tion's total population. 

More than 90 percent of the non­
white population will continue to he 
black and most of it will he young. 
The eight million children who were 
between 5 and 19 years of age in 
1966 will comprise 34 percent of the 
20 to 30 age group. 

Minority groups will continue to 
occupy central cities of America or at 
best some of the close-in suburbs. 

Continuing race pride and its var­
ious manifestations will he present, 
although violence will he more the 
exception than the rule. 

Desegregation and what should he 
its counterpart, equal opportunity, 
will continue as a major goal, as op­
posed to seeking immediate integra­
tion on all levels-educational, social, 
economic. 

The attitudes of the majority popu­
lation toward minority and other per­
sons will he based primarily on eco­
nomic status rather than on race or 
ethnic hackground. 

With this as the future, what then 
of the present? The picture is not 
encouraging as poor race relations 
and lack of communication have pre-

vented the most important entities of 
our society from effectively reaching 
and influencing the minority com­
munity. This is true for business as 
well as Federal and local govern­
ments, educational institutions, urban 
communities, in fact all aspects of 
American life. Therefore, the prob­
lem of interracial communication 
must be solved before full equality of 
opportunity can he extended to all 
persons, and it has to he solved 
quickly. 

It is clear that there are only two 
institutions which can either sepa­
rately or together carry this off. They 
are Government, because of its great 
enforcement powers, and business-in­
dustry, because of its financial re­
sources, job opportunities, and effi­
ciency. 

Business-industry could lead the 
way if it chooses to do so. As a for 
instance, take a leaf from the General 
Electric (GE) Company's hook on 
how it intends to proceed in the 
1970's, In its "Our Future Business 
Environment" (April 1968), the first 
in a series of reports on major envi­
ronmental trends, GE identified the 
urban minority as the "dominant one 
on the domestic social, political and 
economic scene for the next ten 
years". 

GE then followed with "A Decade 
of Tensions and Decisions: The Mi­
nority Environment in the Seventies" 
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{January 1970) which, like the first 
study, was based upon a review of 
available literature and extensive in­
terviews with informed people­
white and nonwhite-at the national 
and community_ levels. These studies 
represented one element in the sys­
tematic analysis, by the equal oppor­
tunity/minority relations component 
in GE's Corporate Industrial Rela­
tions, of minority relations problems 
and of the corporate role in their so­
lutions. 

Working with an executive-level 
policy panel and an advisory panel of 
key relations managers, this compo­
nent has studied and produced rec­
ommendations for corporate action 
in six major areas: environmental 
trends; corporate rationale; manage­
ment support; employee relations as­
pects; soc!a\ problems; and business 
opportunities. 

Following these studies, GE pro­
duced a 42-page booklet, General 
Electric' s Commitment to Progress in 
Equal Opportunity and Minority Re­
lations-A Case Study in Systems 
Analysis Approach to Social Respon­
sibility Programs. In opening re­
marks, Fred J. Borch, Chairman of 
the Board and Chief Executive 
Officer of GE said: 

Photos: Robert D. Moeser, Department of Labor 

We can no longer delay action. We 
cannot-as a society-bear the cost 

of chaos in the lives of millions of 
our citizens. Let me make this unmis­
takeably plain. General Electric, and 
the entire company, must face up to a 
new corporate responsibility. All em­
ployees should understand and coop­
erate with the company's efforts in 
accepting this responsibility. The suc­
cessful manager of tomorrow will be 
the individual who can effectively 
manage the new work force in our 
changing environment. He will be the 
manager who can convince all em­
ployees and our community neigh­
bors that our actions are in the long 
term best interests of all employees, 
the business and the country. Society 
will measure General Electric and all 
industry on this basis . ... 

To play a role in social problem­
solving, industry must first determine 
if it is in fact going to attack the 
total problem of inequality for mi­
nority America, and then proceed to 
act under what could be called a 
"Corporate Opportunity Plan". 

The implementation of this plan 
will call for a new type of "Super­
Sensitive Executhre",. with broad and 
clearly defined re!:!ponsibilities, who 

will be unlike some of the equal op­
portunity executives in business and 
industry today who only look upon 
their responsibilities as a temporary 
job assignment, confined to the spe­
cific area of job opportunities for mi-

nority groups. This corporate oppor­
tunity officer will have wider hori­
zons than equal employment opportu­
nity alone. He will be concerned with 
the racial makeup of the communities 
in which the company operates or 
proposes to operate; with the housing 
and transportation situations for mi­
nority group members; with the _ad­
ministration of justice for minorities; 
and with what the community is 
doing as a whole to combat racism 
and discrimination. 

He sees his company not as a mere 
employer with no responsibility for 
its minority group employees other 
than to assure them a job, but rather 
as a positiv; force in the community 
to bring about the extensions of op­
portunity for all people in the areas 
of housing, education, etc. 

If the man or woman is not from 
a minority group and is as most 
of those who administer programs 
(white, of course) today, he will have 
to undergo some intense "sensitizing" 
on race relations in America. Few 
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executives have had the benefit of 
this before undertaking assignments 
in the area of race relations. 

With the responsibility of develop• 
ing needed guidelines, this executive 
should have no other responsibilities 
than to determine how his corpora­
tion should respond with financial as­
sistance and/or manpower to analyze 
current efforts, and to help create 
programs to meet the needs of minor­
ity groups in housing, employment 
opportunity, administration of jus­
tice, and the reduction of the level of 
racism. 

The executive concerned with the 
total approach should he in a staff 
position answerable only to top man­
agement, with an adequate staff and 
budget to get the assignment done. 

This corporate opportunity officer 
should have authorization to re­
search, analyze, and plan programs 
in which the company can become 
involved in the priority areas. 

With the information compiled, an­
alyzed, and a plan approved, it 
should then he presented first to top 
management, then to middle manage­
ment, and an adaptation then pre­
sented to all employees so that at all 
levels there is a clear understanding 
of what the program is all about. 

The first step in the formulation of 
a plan is for the Corporate Opportu­
nity Staff to take steps to obtain in­
formation on the types of communi­
ties in which the company is opera­
ting or will he operating. Such infor­
mation will include the racial makeup 
of the community; the housing situa­
tion for minority groups; which mi­
nority group employment opportu­
nity programs, if any, are working 
and which are not; how justice is 
administered to minority persons; 
and what the community is doing as 
a whole to combat racism and dis­
crimination. 

Inherent in this type of searching 
examination is the rationale that dis­
tinguishes the type of program being 
proposed from those that now oper­
ate to insure equal employment op­
portunity. The new type of program 
would he concerned not only with 
meaningful employment, hut with the 
problems of adequate education, 
equal administration of justice, and 
the elimination of discrimination in 
all fol'ms at the same time. 

It must be explained that merely 
offeripg a few more jobs or monetary 
assistance for minority-owned enter­
prises is not enough, nor is it com­
pletely effective. A job in itself does 
not reduce the level of racism; nor 
does a new plant opening in the sub­
urbs without plans for transportation 
bring cheer to inner-city and ghetto 
residents. There has to be a total pro­
gram; a systems approach that deals 
with problems encountered by minor­
ity group members as related to one 
another, and hence, only solvable 
through a total program. When the 
program is developed, guidelines for 
a course of action must be estab­
lished in concert w.ith minority and 
other community)eaders, whose sup­
·port is vital. 

Once this information is communi-

cated internally it then should be 
communicated first to leadership or­
ganizations in both the white and 
nonwhite communities. As part two 
of a two step flow of external commu­
nication, the second part should be 
the communication through media to 
reach the broad levels of the total 
community. It is important that both 
the minority and nonminority com­
munities be made to feel that they 
will have an active role in bringing 
about racial harmony, cooperation, 
and opportunity for all. 

The Corporate Opportunity Staff 
should also build into its master plan 
the means by which various depart­
ments and units within the company 
could participate in its implementa­
tion. For example, how the personnel 
department could improve its com­
munication, recruitment, and related 
efforts among minority groups could 
be important in the light of current 
conditions. Many problems still re­
main in meaningful employment op­
portunities for minorities and the 
communication of success stories. 

Every company of any size has its 
own internal training unit for sales, 
management, on-the-job, or other 
training. The "Executive" would 
have ultimate responsibility for tak­
ing a look at public educational prob­
lems and programs with the compa­
ny's and community's needs in mind. 
Undoubtedly there are supplementary 
training techniques which could be 
built into public education programs 
in order to make them more relevant 
to business requirements. Through 
their own internal requirements and 
experiences, personnel of the em­
ployee training unit could conduct re­
view and analysis of education and 
training offered minorities. Determi­
nation could he made and proposals 
formulated as to what changes are 
necessary in public training as well 
as the training units within the cor-
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poration. Perhaps business can in­
struct educators on how to include 
the necessary pretraining in public 
education. • 

In addition, most large corpora­
tions have legal staffs which could he 
utilized to insure equal administra­
tion of justice in those communities 
which the company serves. This staff 
might participate in review and anal­
ysis of how minorities are treated at 
the hands of law enforcement agents 
and come up with suggestions and 
guidelines as to how equal justice 
might become more real. 

A housing committee-comprised 
of executives concerned with plant lo­
cations, site selection, plant improve­
ment, and so forth-coqJd he ere-

14, 

ated, if it is not already in existence, 
to review housing conditions for mi­
nority persons. 'fheir expertise, com­
bined with that of others in the 
public and private sectors, could help 
make adequate housing available to 
minority group persons. In the first 
place, very few companies are mak­
ing site selections· with availability of 
low- and moderate-income housing 

0 

for minorities taken into considera­
tion. Actually, if this type of housing 
does not exist, these circumstances 
could he used to the advantage of the 
corporation and the community. 

As of the end of 1969, in more 

than 50 cities more than half of all 
rental units were substandard; pnly 
70 percent of black homes were rated 
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by the Government as "sound". The 
market in housing has to he one of 
the biggest opportunities for compa­
nies not only to help solve some 
social problems, hut also to make 
profits. This area offers unlimited po­
tential. 

In Camden, New Jersey, under 
what is called "partnership in hous­
ing", Campbell Soup Company, in 
concert with the Department of Hous­
ing and Urban Development, has pro­
vided millions of dollars for the 
building of housing which will result 
in virtually rebuilding the city. 

Another example, Construction for 
Progress, a company jointly owned 
by American Standard, Inc. and 
Celanese Corporation, erected low-in-
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come housing in East Harlem last 
year. Picture this area made up of 60 
percent Puerto Ricans and 35 percent 
blacks. Densely populated, 50 percent 
of the housing had been labeled as 
"deteriorating" and 14 percent as 
"dilapidated". Construction for Prog­
ress turned an old parking lot into 
a new apartment building which 
housed 66 families. This became 
known as New York's first turnkey 
public housing project. The company 
earned a 3.5 percent profit and ex­
pects to equal or exceed that figure 
on future projects. This success for: 
mula can work for other companies 
willing to take the challenge, and 
there are many other opportunities 
than housing. 

The market department, if it is not 
doing so already, might he asked to 
explore ways in which the company 
could better utilize minority busi­
nesses for products and services. This 
department could certainly provide 
assistance to minority group busi­
nessmen to make them active and 
successful participants in the Ameri­
can business community. At the same 
time, the marketing department 
might determine if it is getting its 
full share of the consumer markets 
among minority groups. 

Minority group retailers who are 
being encouraged by the menswear 
retail interests are getting credit, 
technical advice, and other services 
to encourage new channels of distri­
bution in the ever increasing central 
cities of America. Central cities of 
America are minority group popu­
lated. 

These new owners, with a piece of 
the action, are becoming symbols of 
what America is all about. There are 
still not enough of them, of course, 
but they are growing. Suits, shoes, 
shirts, accessories will find a new out­
let for distribution, and the compa• 
nies behind them will find a profit 
from the ghetto. 
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Singer Company has opened its 
first of 65 inner-city franchise stores 
that the company has planned. Singer 
is doing it for the business opportu­
nity. 

Control Data is helping to over­
come its labor shortage and some of 
the employment problems in poor 
communities as well. It has built 
three plants-a pilot plant in Minne­
apolis; Washington, D.C.; Appala­
chia; and a fourth is planned for St. 
Paul. All are in poor areas, providing 
jobs. The interesting thing about the 
fourth plant is that it will only he 
staffed with part-time workers to 
meet the work needs of the commun­
ity. Control Data will make a profit 
and fill a need as well. 

P. Ballantine & Sons, Monsanto, 
and Pillsbury are all working, under 
Government grants, to develop en­
riched foods for the hungry of Amer­
ica through new products. Think 
what this can mean not only to the 
hungry of America, hut of the world 
when these products are perfected. It 
has to result in a profit for those 
companies-not only the three men­
tioned-if they turn their hands to 
filling this need. 

Rather than one small @it in a 
personnel department being asked to 
carry the burden of how a company 
expands job opportunities for minor­
ity groups, it is recommended that a 
multi-department systems approach 
he used through a highly sensitized 
staff coordinator. 

The functions that are required by 
the Federal Government, such as re­
porting systems, could become one of 
the responsibilities of a new staff unit 
hut it would have to function far be­
yond this reporting system to he 
effective in the total approach that is 
needed. 

Minority groups have for the most 
part never been efficiently or suffi­
ciently communicated with, particu­
larly in matters of corporate and 

Government interests that directly 
affect them. Minority group members 
will have to become convinced that 
there are solutions to problems; that 
the people who have helped make this 
Nation the technological leader in the 
world are also concerned about mak­
ing equal opportunity a workable 
reality. 

At the conclusion of the GE book­
let on systems analysis approach to 
insuring equal opportunity, the fol­
lowing was printed: 

It is not unreasonable to assert 
that the decade of the Seventies will 
see a new testing of the American 
system. Just as our political system 
was tested and adjusted in the 1860's, 
and our economic system in the 
1930's, so our social system will be 
tested in the 1970's for its ability to 
provide opportunities for all minori­
ties to move into the mainstream of 
American life. Since there is no in­
evitability about the outcome of this 
test, leadership decisions will have a 
determinate effect on the future 
course of events. This is true leader­
ship in both white and nonwhite 
cpmmunities, in government, educa­
tion, labor and business. To reduce 
it to a single specific instance, Gen­
eral Electric's managerial decisions 
and actions can be effective in help­
ing to shape the minority environ­
ment in which the Company will have 
to operate. 

This kind of thinking and commit­
ment and its successful implementa­
tion, multiplied over and over again 
by business and industry, could make 
equality of opportunity for minority 
group persons, and a better America, 
a reality. 

D. PARKE GIBSON 

Mr. Gibson has spent 20 years in problem­
solving and interracial communications, the 
last ten as head of a national public rela­
tions and marketing consulting firm ad­
vising some of the Nation's largest corpora­
tions. He is -author of the book The $30 
Billion Negro. 
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An
annroach 

to 
minorilY 
IUnding 

The need to provide financial, en­
couragement for minority-owned en­
terprises has received wordy benedic­
tion from Gov~rnment and banking 
leaders. The black capitalist has yet 
to see the word made cash. For too 
many black businessmen, the situa­
tion is one largely of plus a change 
plus c'est la meme chose. In the fol­
lowing article, Clarence Dunnaville 
cites unsettling examples of the bar­
riers against finding funds for black 
entrepreneurs. He also describes one 
organization's seven-point program 
for starting and keeping blacks in 
major business ventures. 

While there are more black ~ntre­
preneurs today than previously, little 
impact has been made on the total 
problem of black economic develop­
·ment. Most minority .group entrepre­
neurs still operate small' retail or 
service businesses. There are few 
newly-created black-owned businesses 
that employ more than 50 persons. 
There are still only a handful of 
black-owned radio stations, no black­
owned television,.st.ations, and only a 
few black-owned newspapers of any 
size. No additional black-owned insur­
ance companies have been created in 
recent years; there are still only a 
few black-owned banks; and there is 
no black-owned investment banking 
institution. 

While there have been a few new 
ventures of substance such as Essence 
magazine, getting blacks into signifi­
cant business ventures has by and 
large moved at a "snail-like" pace. 

I believe that one of the reasons so 
little progress has been made in this 
area is that there is iittle pommitment 
by Government or private resources 
to the cop.cept that blacks should be 
senior partners in the American busi­
ness community The Office of Minor­
ity Business Enterprise of the Federal 
Government, for example, has de­
voted its attention primarily to secur-

ing black ownership of gas stations 
and franchises. While there are prof­
itable gas stations and many very 
profitable franchises, it is my view 
that Government commitment should 
be to develop viable b_usinesses of a 
more substantial nature. 

Lack of commitment, of course, is 
not the sole reason for the lack of 
progress in this area. Shortage of 
capital, lack of management and tech­
nical skills, and lack of exposure to 
business remain a part of the prob­
lem. 

Several months ago, I was discuss­
ing the needs of black entrepreneurs 
with a white official of a major New 
York bank. I was shocked when he 
turned to me and said candidly. "I 
am not at all interested in making 
so.me. :cela.tiv:ely weR-off Negroes 
riche:c."· While I do not believe that 
this is the prevailing attitude in most 
New York banks, there are nonethe­
less very real problems in fil).ding 
capital to finance a significant minor­
ity-group-owned enterprise. This is 
particularly true in a start-up situa­
tion. 

Several weeks ago, one of my asso­
ciates approached a venture capital 
corporation affiliated with a major 
New York bank about obtaining eq­
uity capital for a "package" which 
we considered to be extremely attrac­
tive. The package was developed by a 
team of volunteers and assembled by 
the Harvard Business Alumni Club of 
New York. Working on the project 
were a partner of a major investment 
bank, a Certified Public Accountant 
(CPA) associated with a 'big eight' 
accounting firm, consultants from 
leading firms in the particular indus­
try, and the Interracial Council for 
Business Opportunity staff. They had 
put together a proposal complete with 
feasibility study; potential customers, 
management background, and finan­
cial projections. 

Financial requirements totaled 
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about $200,000. The principals had 
invested $40,000 of their own money 
and presented a balanced manage­
ment team with substantial experi­
ence in the field. It was contempl_ated 
that additional equity money of ap­
proximately $40,000 from a venture 
capital corporation would he needed, 
the balance being financed through 
hank loans and equipment financing. 
The official of the venture capital 
company we had approached in­
quired whether the venture would he 
minority controlled. When we ad­
vised that it would he, we were told 
that "they were not doing any more 
minority-owned deals" at the present 
time. The official further indicated 
that it would he a waste of time to 
submit the proposal for considera­
tion. 

Securing financing for existing 
businesses is equally difficult. Re­
cently, a New y~rk hank advanced 
$30,000 to a black manufacturer for 
working capital. The loan was 90 per­
cent guaranteed by the Small Business 
Administration (SBA). The projec­
tions upon which the manufacturer 
had based the request for funds were 
overly conservative, and after several 
months the manufacturer had re­
ceived a greater number of orders 
than anticipated. As a result, more 
working capital was required. When 
she went hack to the hank with firm 
orders and requested additional 
funds, the hank declined to make any 
further advances despite the potential 
of the enterprise. 

Minority-group construction con­
tractors face myriad financial prob­
lems, the most serious .of which is the 
lack of adequate working capital to 
"carry their johs"-to pay for labor 
and materials while they are awaiting 
progress payments. New York hanks 
have so far been reluctant to extend 
lines of credit to these businessmen, 
severely limiting the types of jobs 

they can accept. For example, many 
contractors will not hid on Govern­
ment jobs because payment is gener­
ally slow, and most black contractors 
do not have the financial strength to 
carry payroll and other expenses 
while awaiting payment from the 
city, State, or Federal agencies. 

One of the chief problems facing 
minority group entrepreneurs is the 
inaccessibility of short-term funds. 
We have found it virtually impossi1'le 
to obtain interim financing for new 
ventures and almost as difficult to ob­
tain 30-to-90-day money. ~n entre­
preneur looking for a small amount 
of money to meet an emergency situ­
ation will find that n;i.any hanks move 
so slowly that, even if they are in­
clined to make the loan, the situation 
may deteriorate into a crisis while 
the entrepreneur waits for the loan to 
he approved. 

There are a few nonprofit agencies 
that a:re devoting their attention to 
helping black entrepreneurs solve 
some of these problems, and the old­
est of these organizations is the Inter­
racial Council for Business Opportu­
nity (ICBO). 

The ICBO was organized in New 
York City in 1963 by the American 
Jewish Congress and the National 

Urban League. Today, 8 years after 
its founding, ICBQ is a national non­
pr~fit organization, with offices in 
New York, Los Angeles, Newark, 
New Orleans, Dallas, St. Louis, and 
Washington, D.C. It has a total 
budget of only approximately $1.5 
.million used to assist minority group 
businessmen around the country. Fi­
nancial support for ICBO comes pri­
marily from foundations and private 
corporations. In addition, there are 
specific Government contracts which 
provide a small percentage of its op­
erating budget. 

There are seven principal pro­
grams fostered by the ICBO: 

I. Small Business Development 
Program 

ICBO was originally designed to 
assist the small minority proprietor 
who either owned or wanted to start 
his own business enterprise. Today, 
ICBO still services the neighborhood 
shopkeeper, the franchisee, and other 
small businessmen. ICBO councils 
help this segment of the business 
community enter business and, more 
importantly, to stay in business. It 
provides voluntary consultants to 
work with the businessman, and over 
the years ICBO has helped more 
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than 3,000 small business clients. It 
has used approximately 2,500 con­
sultants and has generated over 
$9,000,000 worth of loans. 

2. Major Business Development 
Program 

ICBO recognized during the early 
stages of its existence that, if minor­
ity groups are going to share in U.S. 
prosperity in a meaningful way, busi­
ness development on a more impor­
tant scale is absolutely essential, espe­
cially in the manufacturing, service, 
and construction areas. ICBO has es­
tablished a major business develop-··· 
ment program to foster the formation 
of ventures with a capitalization of at 
least $100,000 which also affords 
maximum opportunities for minority 
employment. However, if this pro­
gram is to he meaningful, support is 
needed from hanks, Government, and 
corporate organizations. 

3. Corporate Services ~rogram . 

This program is designed to pro­
vide information on black businesses 
to major firms throughout the coun­
try. These services range from identi­
fying black manufacturers who can 
act as suppliers to setting up joint 
ventures, subsidiary companies, and 
Government-aided investment compa­
nies. 

4. Government and Corporate 
Veudors Program 

The ICBO vendors program was 
established out of recognition of the 
need for a nationwide organization 
to assist corporations, Government 
agencies, and other institutions which 
seek to utilize minority group sup­
pliers., This program was set up in 
1970 and has already begun to make 
some impact.. We. have found, how­
ever, that far too few corporations 
and Government agencies will give 
minority group vendors substantial 

orders. Most corporations which say 
they are willing to buy from minori­
ties appear willing to buy in token 
amounts only. Additional "set aside" 
legislation is needed to prod Federal, 
State, and local agencies into pur­
chasing from minority suppliers. 

5. Management Training and 
Development Services 

A large percentage of minority 
group entrepreneurs lack business ex­
perience and background. To help al­
leviate this problem, ICBO has or­
ganized what is perhaps one of the 
best adult business management train­
ing schools in the country. The 
courses offered include general busi­
ness principles, merchandising, new 
business development, profit plan­
ning, bookkeeping, accounting, and 
workshops for individual industries. 
Instructors are volunteer businessmen 
and corporate executives. 

Clients who do not have a back­
ground in business management are 
encouraged to enroll in the manage­
ment training courses. The courses, 
for which there are no charges, are 
open to all, not limited to ICBO 
clients. Students of all ages and edu­
cational backgrounds, in business or 
prospective businessmen, from highly 
specialized and technical to local one­
man operations, have participated in 
ICBO Business Management Courses. 
One of the great strengths of ICBO 

is its cadre of volunteer consultants. 
Virtually all ICBO clients are as­
signed consultants to provide man­
agerial, technical, or financial advice 
on an ongoing basis. 

6. Capital Resources Program 

Through the capital resources com­
mittee of each local ICBO council, 
the organization helps arrange loans 
from commercial hanks and other 
funding agencies. In 1968, the ICBO 
Fund was organized to guarantee a 
portion of client loans. The fund 
provides guarantees for high-risk 
loans which would otherwise not he 
granted. Recently, ICBO established 
a Minority Enterprise Small Business 
Investment Company (MESBIC) cap­
italized at $1 million with funds pro­
vided by the Ford Foundation, Met­
ropolitan Life Insurance Company, 
the Episcopal Church, and several 
private investors. 

A MESBIC is formed when private 
investors put up a minimum of 
$150,000 in capital, incorporate as an 
investment company, and obtain a li­
cense from SBA. After the MESBIC 
is in operation, it is eligible to bor­
row $2,000 from SBA for every 
$1,000 it has in private capital, from 
a minimum of $300,000 to a maxi­
mum of $7.5 million. These funds are 
to he used as seed money in huxi­
nesses owned by minority group 
members. The investments are re-
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quired to he long-term debt (5-to 
20-year loans) or equity investments. 

As of November 1970, there were 
only 19 licensed MESBIC's nation­
wide. Many have not as yet made any 
investments. We have gone to MES-

·-·=i3IC's on a number of occasions with 
proposals, hut have found their poli­
cies to he conservative. The ICBO 
MESBIC will offer a new tool to 
ICBO clients. 

7. Project Transfer Program 
Project Transfer is a specialized 

program for minority group men and 
women seeking to buy an existing 
business. ICBO assists the prospective 
buyer by supplying consultants who 
will evaluate the business in question, 
help negotiate the terms of sale, and 
help arrange for financing of the 
business. This program is particu­
larly valuable to minority persons 
presently managing or working in a 
white-owned business whose owners 
may he considering selling out. 

Through these seven programs 
ICBO offers the most extensive serv­
ices of any organization aiding mi­
nority businessmen. It is limited, 
howevei:, by the resources available 
to it. As I noted earlier, its entire 
operating budget nationwide is only 
$1.5 million: we need many times 
this amount in order to do an effec­
tive job. 

We have found that too many cor­
porations and organizations are not 
sympathetic to putting minority group 
persons into . significant businesses. 
They prefer to talk about the "hard 
core", rather than hacking educated, 
middle class minority members who 
have the potential to make an impact 
on their group's economic develop­
ment. 

What, then, can he done? 
Needed is a massive program for 

minority group economic develop­
ment. Government-Federal, State, 
and local-must provide leadership 

and establish this goal as a high na­
tioI_Ial priority. A national minority 
group development hank on the order 
of the old Reconstruction Finance 
Corporation should he explored. 

In addition, management training 
is essential. Major corporations should 
he training black executives who 
could then become entrepreneurs. A 
cadre of trained black managers is 
clearly a primary need. 

The hanks must do more. Some 
hanks are now making loans to mi­
nority group persons, hut they are 
certainly not doing what they should 
he doing, and some hanks are doing 
nothing at all. A few hanks have re­
cently established special programs 
for minority group entrepreneurs, 
hut they require guarantees automati­
cally, even when the person has a 
strong background and a guarantee 
would not he required if the entrepre• 
neur were white. 

There should he a pool of funds 
availahle-shor.t-term loans a.nd 
emergency funds with minimum red 
tape. Contractors sorely need this 
type of assistance. 

Private corporations must deal 
with minorities as suppliers and give 
them significant, not token, business. 

Finally, ICBO and organizations 
with similar aims should he strength­
ened. These are the groups respond­
ing to the real challenge of the seven­
ties-bringing hlacks and other mi­
norities into the economic main­
stream. But this work cannot he done 
by them alone-leadership and sup­
port must come from Government at 
all levels, foundations, corporations, 
churches, and organizations. 

CLARENCE M. DUNNAVILLE 

Mr. Dunnaville, an attorney for Western 
Electric, is presently on loan to the Inter­
racial Council for Business Opportunity 
(ICBO) of New York as its Executive Di­
rector. This article is reprinted from Th~ 
MBA, February 1971, by permission. Copy­
right © 1971 by MBA Enterprises, Inc. 
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PAROCHIAL SCHOOLS: 
Adelay in desegregation 

A civil lawsuit instituted by a group of black Catho­
lic parents, requesting that the Federal court order 
desegregation of the Catholic schools of Opelousas, 
Louisiana, could set a precedent and be instrumental 
in desegregating the parochial schools in the South 
and perhaps in the North as well. 

Integration of parochial schools is a sensitive topic. 
It became a public issue throughout the South after 
court rulings forced the integration of public schools. 
This action caused large numbers of parents to trans­
fer ,their children from public to parochial schools. In 
one rural diocese the busing of former public school 
pupils to parochial schools outside the municipal 
boundaries in order to avoid the integrat~d public 
schools was sanctioned. Many parochial schools 
throughout the Nation have promoted, intentionally or 
unintentionally, racial isolation in the schools. 

Historically, in the North and the South, the Catho­
lic Church has operated nationally and racially identi­
fiable Catholic schools. In certain Southern and border 
States, church schools had been racially segregated by 
law. In the North, particularly in the cities, church 
schools had been generally associated with immigrant 
groups and were easily identified as a national group 
by language. Such nationally identifiable schools are 
contrary to the law insofar as they discriminate on the 
basis of national origin. Because the number of na­
tional schools has dramatically decreased, this discus­
sion is restricted to racial discrimination. In the cities 
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today church schools are predominantly white with the 
black enrollment concentrated in a few all-black 
schools located in the inner-city. 

Although a federally financed survey is now being 
conducted, accurate nationwide statistics on the racial 
composition of individual private and parochial schools 
are not yet available because neither the Government 
nor private organizations has attempted to gather 
them. This is partly because of the private and reli­
gious character of such schools and the anticipated 
noncooperation of many administrators. Some infor­
mation is presented in the table on page 25 , but it 
should be understood that the public and ecclesiastical 
school systems are not coterminus. This table indicates 
that the racial composition of the p_ublic school systems 
is significantly different from the local parochial sys­
tem. 

Of the 4,672,510 parochial school enrollment in 
1969-70, only 5.1 percent of the elementary and 3.7 
percent of the secondary students were black. These 
figures are more significant because Catholic schools 
are often concentrated in certain States and c_ities 
which also have high black populations; e.g., the 
States of Louisiana and Maryland and the cities of 
Chicago, Philadelphia, New Orleans, Newark, Detroit, 
and St. Louis. 

Parochial schools are becoming increasingly white 
for several reasons. A reduction in black student en­
rollment is caused by the fact that many schools have 
closed in the inner-city. Since 1967, the number of 
inner-city elementary schools has decreased by 73 and 
the secondary schools by 37. The rise in tuition rates 
also has had a negative influence on the enrollment of 
black students. The flow of students fleeing in the 
opposite direction from integrated public schools has 
increased white enrollment in many parochial schools. 
Large numbers of white students on the occasion of 
court-ordered integration of the public schools have 
been accepted into parochial schools. During the 
1969-70 school year more than 6,700 white students 
seeking to avoid integration of the Louisiana public 
schools were accepted into Catholic schools causing 
them to become havens for segregationists. For exam­
ple, 46 percent of the students now enrolled in one 
Louisiana school have transferred from the integrated 
public schools during the past 2 years. 

Analyzing the enrollment figures for New Orleans 
Catholic schools of 9,341 black and 25,945 white stu­
dents, the extent of the racial isolation can be well 
illustrated. During the current s~hool year, the city 

contains 12 all-black schools with an enrollment of 
5,084 and three all-white. schools with an enrollment of 
1,621 students. Defining "predominantly" to mean 90 
tp 99.9 percent, there are also four predominantly 
black schools with enrollments totalling 1,336 [11 
white students]; and also 35 schools predominantly 
white with a total enrollment of 20,019, of ~hich only 
625 were black. In summary, during the current school 
year in the Catpolic schools of New Orleans, 6,409 
black students and 21,015 white students are clearly in 
raqialiy isolated situations. 

The particular sit-liation in Opelousas, Louisiana, 
which caused Ca.tholic parents of students attending an 
all-black school to file a court cas~ against three Catho­
lic school boards and their members· (including two 
bishops) , can add further descriptive aspects about the 
racial isolation. The plaintiffs seek a court order re­
quiring the Lafayette Diocesan School Board and the 
sc;:hool boards of the black school (Holy Ghost) and 
t~e white school (Academy of the Immaculate Concep­
tion) to use both facilities to serve one totally inte­
grated student body. 

The complaint states that the actions of the defend­
ants violate the plaintiff's rights in four separate ways: 
(1) rights under the 14.th Amendment to equal protec­
tion before the law; (2) rights under the Civil Rights 
Act of 1866 (42 U.S.C. § 1981) for equal contract 
treatment; (3) third party beneficiary rights under the 
contr~cts which defendants have made with the Fed­
eral Government; and (4) that the tax benefits to the 
schools and their benefactors support the defendants to 
the injury of the plaintiffs' constitutional rights. 

Violation of 14th Amendment Rights 
There are several bases for finding 14th Amendment 

requirements regarding school desegregation applica­
ble to parochial schools. 

First, the educating function performed by the par­
ochial schools is a State purpose. The education of 
children of the State is an obligation of the State. 
However, just as the local public schools perform con­
stitutional duties and obligations of the State govern­
ment on behalf of the State as far as education is con­
cerned, so, too, do the parochial schools. The white 
Catholic school established in 1856 and the black 
Catholic school established in 1874 have educated 
thousands of Louisiana citizens. By a Special Act of 
the 1916 Session of the Louisiana State Legislature, 
the Academy of the Immaculate Conception in Ope­
lousas was recognized and empowered to train teachers 
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and principals for work in the State public schools. 
Several acts of the Louisiana Legislature have stated 
that parochial schools are serving secular purposes. 
They do the work of the State because the pupils of 
Catholic schools would otherwise be enrolled in a 
public school. 

Church organizations, such as the U.S. Catholic 
Conference, when proposing public aid to parochial 
schools, have insisted that nonpublic schools assist and 
serve the State in its educational function. Nonpublic 
educational institutions educate 15 percent of all ele­
mentary and secondary school students in Louisiana. 
The Department of Health, Education, and Welfare 
(HEW) statistics for the 1968-69 school year show 
that 87~ 2 percent of the nonpublic schools in the 
United States are Roman Catholic. The rationale for 
State aid to parochial schools is a public purpose argu­
ment-that very same rationale proves a State relation­
ship which makes the 14th Amendment applicable. 

The second basis for applying the 14th Amendment 
is that the acceptance of numerous controls and restric­
tions by the parochial schools in their administration 
reveals an agency relationship to the State in its edu­
cating function.. The administration of the parochial 
schools i11 Louisiana is in accordance with State re­
quirements regarding attendance, transportation, re­
quired courses of study, certification, certification of 
teachers, athletic events, distribution of books and ma­
terials free of costs, food preparation and service, 
safety regulations, sight and hearing examination, and 
others. Only by sifting facts and weighing circum­
stances can the non-obvious involvement of the State 
in· private conduct be attributed its true significance. 

The willing acknowledgment and acceptance by the 
parochial schools of the State regulations in the opera­
tion of their institutions reveals an agency relationship. 
Therefore, the agents of the State are subject to the 
con~tiiutional restraints ~n Government action to the 
same ext.ent as are private persons who govern a com­
pany or control a political party, or run a streetcar 
and bus service, or operate a train terminal. If the 

I 

14th Amendment is applicable to th~ princip.al, it is 
equaliy applicable to the.agent of th_e principal. 

The third basis upon which 14th Amendment juris­
diction can he founded is that when a State has a 
constitutional duty -to prevent certain' consequences in 
the perform'ance of a particular State function, and 
·when it allows a private entity to· carry out that func­
tion in violation of that duty, the State, by its 
failure to prevent such intervention, violates the 

equal protection clause. To allow a violation of the 
14th Amendment to continue in private schools, while 
enforcing the same rights in public schools at the same 
time, would be to encourage private schpols to deny 
constitutional rights. It would be incongruous for the 
State to demand recognition of lesser pupil rights, such 
as health and safety regulations by parochial schools, 
while not requiring recognition of the rights to an 
equal education free from racial discrimination. 

The fourth basis for finding 14th Amendment juris­
diction is the amounts of monies received under the 
various programs sponsored by the local, State, and 
Federal governments. According to exhibits filed in the 
court .by defendants, the 57 Lafayette diocesan schools 
received .$2,143,969 from governmental sources during 
the 1969-70 school year, thereby revealing the govern­
mental involvement. 

Violation of Third Party Rights 
Under Assurance Contract 

The parochial schools of the Lafayette Diocese have 
entered into contracts with State and Federal agencies; 
and have acknowledged in correspondence the applica­
bility of the laws and regulations against racial dis­
crimination in the schools. On March 1, 1965, the 
superintendent of the Lafayette Diocese signed and 
submitted Amendment No. 1 to the National School 
Lunch Program Agreement whereby the diocese gave 
assurances that it was in compliance and would 
comply with requirements of the Department of Agri­
culture (29 F.R. 16274). These requirements are that 
no pers~n in the schools shall, on the grounds of race, 
he e_xcluded from participation in, be denied the bene­
fits of, or be otherwise subjected to discrimjnation 
under the program. Similar assurances were signed by 
the. superintendent for the diocese on August 6, 1967; 
June 25, 1968; July 1, 1969; ·and' Octbber 27, 1970. 
Correspondence between the superintendent of the La­
fayette Diocese and representatives of-HEW. regarding 
the applicability of the Title VI Guidelines was begun 
irr 1965. On May 10, 1967, the d_iocese submitted 
a school desegregation plan which pro.niised, among 
other things, that 2,000 black students w·ould be en­
rolled in racially mixed schools by September 1970. 
On the basis of this desegregation plan and the 
representatives of the diocese, the Federal Govenunent 
extended financial assistance to the schools. Harold 
Howe, II, then United States Commissioner of Educa­
tion, wrote to the diocese on May 24, 1967: 

It is our understanding that you will implement 
those plans already submitted for further desegrega-
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tion of your school system and that you will con­
tinue to make and implement further plans directed 
toward the elimination of all vestiges of the dual 
school system. 

The diocesan school board took no steps beyond 
"persuasion" and "encouragement" to remove the racial 
imbalance in the diocesan schools. Indeed, rather than 
increasing the number of black students in integrated 
diocesan schools, the results of the policy of persuasion 
were negative. Since 1967 the racial compositions of 
the schools shown by the diocesan school board's 
records have been as follows: 

White Nonwhite Nonwhite Enrollment 
Enrollment Enrollment in Integrated schools 

1967-68 16,188 5,185 33.6 
1968-69 14,767 4,922 873 
1969-70 16,500 4,958 556 

All the schools were .predominantly (90-100 percent) 
black or white except one school whose total enroll­
ment was ·260 students of whom 42 w~re black. The 
veto of the proposed faculty integration of the 
schools in Opelousas on May 1969 was the immediate 
cause of the lawsuit. By submitting the school desegre­
gation plan to HEW in 1967 and signing the assurance 
contracts, the diocese freely accepted the obligation to 
bar racial discrimination in the school independent of 
being required to do so by another legal or moral 
source. The church school officials can hardly deny 
that the veto, as well as their own actions and in­
actions, .has broken the 1967 contractual promise to 
have eliminated the dual schools. 

Violation of Civil Rights Action of 1866 

Aside from rights under the 14th Amendment, de­
fendants have depr-ived plaintiffs of their rights to 
contract without racial discrimination to attend the 
white Catholic school. The Civil Rights Act of 1866 
(42 U.S.C. § 1981) provides that: 

All persons within the jurisdiction of the United 
States shall have the same right in every state and 
territory t_o 7nflke and en/orce contracts~ is. en­
joyed by white citizens. 

This section has been construed by the courts in Scott 
v. Young, 421 F2f 1943 (1970) as section 1982 has 
been construed by the Court in ]ones v. Mayer, 392 
U.S. 409 (1968); Sullivan v. Little Hunting Park, 
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Inc., 396 U.S. 229 (1969). In Scott, the court found 
the right of admission in return for a fee is "unques­
tionably a contract. . . . Refusal to extend the same 
contractual opportunity to blacks is, as the district 
court decided, a viol<!tion of 42 U.S.C. § 1981." Pay­
ment of tuition creates a contract to receive an educa­
tion: the policy and practice of the schools' boards 
whereby white students attend one school and black 
students attend a separate school has limited the con­
tractual opportunity of the plaintiffs. 

Tax Benefits To The Schools 
And Their Benefactors 

Segregated schools do not serve the best interests of 
black or white pupils. The evils occasioned by segre­
gated schools violate rights secured by the Constitution 
of the United States. The policy of the United States 
Government as enunciated by numerous cases and 
Presidential statements is to eradicate racial segrega­
tion in schools. It would be inconsistent with ·this 
public policy for the court to ignore schools· which 
operate and promote a counter policy. 

The Federal courts have recently enjoined the Inter­
nal Revenue Service from granting tax exemption sta­
tus to schools which were established to become ha­
vens for students fleeing the integration of the public 
schools, on grounds that such action would frustrate 
the orders of the court requiring integration of the 
public schools. Just as the court does not allow viola­
tors of the law to deduct court fines from their tax 
returns because a tax deduction would be an indirect 
encouragement of further violations, allowing par­
ochial schools to evade the applicability of the public 
policy for school integration also would he counter to 
the overall stated public policy. 

Uncontested facts indicate that significant numbers 
of white students left the public schools when the court 
ordered integration of the public schools, and these 
students were allowed to enroll in the Catholic schools. 
The white Catholic school in Opelousas had a 22 per­
cent increase in enrollment when the public schools 
were integrated in September 1969. This "white flight" 
from the integrated public schools to the all-white or 
predominantly white ,Catholic schools threatens the ef­
ficacy of the court imposed integration ·of the p_ublic 
schools. This same process has occurred throughout 
the State of Louisiana. When the public schools were 
integrated in September 1969, not only did the white 
Catholic school in Opelousas have a 22 percent in-
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Public School System* Catholic School System 

#Black Percent #White Percent #Black Percent #White Percent 

Baltimoret 125,174 65 66,997 34.9 

Chicagot 308,260 52.9 219,478 37.7 28,000 9.36 271,000 90.6 

NewOrleanst 74,375 67.1 34,673 31.3 9,341 13 25,945 86.7 

New York Cityt 334,641 31.5 467,365 43.9 31,000 4.5 655,000 95.5 

Philadelphtat 166,083 58.8 109,512 38.7 16,500 4.8 326,500 95.1 

Jersey Cityt 15,998 16,457 565 !°2,47,9 
,, 

Waterbury, Conn.t 304 6,841 

*Percentages do not.total 100 because Mexican American and Oriental statistics are omitted: 
tGov~rninental· and ecclesiastical boundaries are not coterminous. 
SOURCE~: Directory of P,ublic Elementary and Secondary Schools in Selected Districts; En,roll!llent and Staff oy Racial/ 
,· .Ethnic Group Fall 1968, U.S. Department of Health, Education, and Welfare. ~ 

crease in enrollment, hut approximateiy.300 white stu­
dents who live in Opelousas ·began attendjng schools 
operated by the diocesan si::hool :board outside the 
city of Opelousas, as far as the city of Lafayette, 20 
miles away. 

This description of the raciaU~platjon in the Catho­
li.c schools of Louisiana reflects what .has happened in 
many dioceses throughout ·the country. Although the 
orig_inal purpose of-these schools was highly laudable 
and great work was accomplished, the present racial 
isolation in many· church schools is the same as that 
produced by a segregated academy. The situation has 
remained unchanged partly because the church "leader­
ship was unwilling or unanle to overcome. the resist­
ance of its members, and partly. heca~se the :federal 
Government has· ·not adequately enforced Title VI of 
the Civil Rights Act of 1964. Both of these causes are 
beyond the purpose of this article, however. 

Although it is essential to draw attention to a seri­
ous cause of racial segregation, 'it is equally ne~essary 
to congratulate the initiative of those citizens who·have 
sought a court order to integ~ate the schools. That suit, 
a:lthoµgh still~ in litigation, has already produced sig­
nificant results. 

The diocesan school hoard had publicly ordered 

integration of ali s9hools by September 19n. Neigh­
boring· diocesan sy1>temi,,have begun to push for inte­
gration of the schools. Regretfully, in some cases tlfe 
diocesan hoard has ordered the closing of th~ black 
Catholic ·scho-ols ~ltho-qgh the faciJities are good. Many 
of the local residents and those involved in the case 
hoped that ahan~-lonment of the black school, a famil­
iar pattern. in public ,;chool 'integration would be 
_avoided ht the Catlioiic• sys~ell!-:because of its ability to 
marshal -religious motives. 'They also hoped that a 
strong moral position would eni!hle the administrators 
to side-step the snar,e. Tlie •pattern being set in this 
pi,o.ces_e will-"greatly influepc;e other dioceses. Perhaps 
the schoqI :hoard wiU reconsider its action of merely 
dosing tl,ie' black scho.6:ls and employ pairing of the 
schools, busing, a:qd tuition S11bsidies as techniques to 
accomplish, imegration -.of the schools. 

The, i?iocese of' Laf~y_ette has been called upon to 
witn.es_s to. its.belief in the .Brotherhood of Man. The 
~?tc·ome ·i.s not yet ·certain, 

REV. JAMES D. CAMPBELL, OP 

Revere_;_.a-cJmpbell,jorrner dirt!~for o/ the Theology Section of 
the Centsr Jor.th.e•Ayplied Re~earcfi in. the Apostolate (CARA), 
is--a,Jounder ·anrl.; treasurer ol the ,Committee for Integrated 
Catholic1Schools. _, 
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1 uNDER­
!STANDING 
SCHOOL 
DESEGRE­
GATION 

Seventeen years after the Supreme 
Court ruled that school segregation 
was unconstitutional, the educational 
system of this country is still en­
gulfed in controversy, misunderstand­
ing, and, to too great an extent, a 
dual school system. 

Although the Nation has been 
awakened to the human and educa­
tional perils of a dual school system 
and certain improvements have be­ ·-
come noticeable, there is still no 
widespread understanding of the na­
ture and scope of the issues and 
public discussion has been more 
heated than enlightening. 

In an effort to clarify the forms 
which school discrimination take, the 
damage it does, and the means of 
combating it, the U.S. Commission on 
Civil Rights. has recently issued, as its 
Clearinghouse Publication No. 28, a 
brochure entitled Understanding 
School Desegregation. 

"The Commission speaks out in the 
hope that it can ,.shed light on the 
issues and, by so doing, contribute to 
their successful resolution. The issue 
of school desegregation, like other is­
sues of national concern, has roots 
deep in our history. To understand 
fully where we are now and to 
form a sound basis for determining 
courses -of action for the future, we 
first must uooerstand what that his­
tory has been," the publication states. 

Beginning with Brown v. Board of 
Education of Topeka, the brochure 
presents the developments which fol­
lowed that historic Supreme Court 
decision. "The 1954 Supreme Court 
decision . . . is the landmark case 
from which modern developments in 
the law of school desegregation flow. 
For more than 50 years before that 
decision, public school systems were 
constitutionally permitted to operate 
under laws which provided for ra-
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cially separate school systems so long 
as those systems also were equal. . . . 
In the South, this doctrine had re­
sulted in the enactment of laws 
officially sanctioning racially separate 
or 'dual' school systems. . . . In the 
North and· West as well, some States 
had enacted and maintained school 
segregation laws. . . . 

"The effect on white children, 
while not as susceptible to objective 
measure, also is damaging. The sys­
tem of school segregation presents 
them with a distorted view of society 
which ill-equips them to enter the 
world of reality.... Social• science 
research increasingly suggests that 
racial integration is a key not only to 
equal educational opportunity, hut 
also to equal educational achieve­
ment.... The school is the most im­
portant public institution hearing on 
the child's development as an in­
formed, educated person and as a 
human being. It is essential that 
our children-black, brown, red, yel­
low, and white-receive the kind of 
training in integrated school environ­
ments that will equip them to thrive 
in t4e multiracial society they will 
enter. Integrated education also is of 
critical importance if we are to heal 
the dangerous divisions in our so­
ciety and if America is to achieve its 
promise-one Nation indivisible. 

"The techniques necessary to 
accomplish desegregation are at 
hand. What is needed is the will to 
bring these techniques to hear on the 
problem. . . . Funds alone are not 
enough. It also is necessary to gener­
ate the will to achieve desegregation. 
. . . As the President has said: 'Our 
national conscience is at stake' and it 
is that, above all, that we cannot af­
ford to compromise at this point in 
our national history." 
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THE 
JOKER 

IN 
PRIVATE 
SCHOOL 

AID 

In the past 2 years-overnight as 
legislatures count time--at least six 
States have passed laws providing 
substantial general aid to private 
schools, and similar bills are pending 
in half a dozen other States. This new 
concern by State legislatures for non­
public education is a response to a 
well-organized Catholic lobby and to 
!;1imple arithmetic: By supporting in 
part the education of children in non­
public sch~ols, nine-tenths of which 
are operated by the Roman Catholic 
Church, they can avoid supporting in 
full the education of the same chil­
dren in public schools. The Supreme 
Court this term will review two lower­
court decisions on comprehensive 
State aid to nonpublic schools: Lem­
on vs. Kurtzman and DiCenso vs. 
Robinson. Both of the decisions are 

being tested for their constitution• 
ality on First Amendment grounds 
because they provide for the pur- ~ 
chase by the State of "secular" edu- ·~ 
cational services for children in pri-
vate schools. 

It is by no means clear how the -
Supreme Court will resolve these 
conflicting decisions. The financial 
impact its decision will have on the 
public school treasury is obvious. 
The impact of the Court's views on 
separation of church and state is a 
subject of great• speculation and 
abundant brief writing, but the pro-
found effects that rejection or ap• 
proval of these particular laws will 
have on the entire course of Ameri-
can education, and in particular on 
its desperately needed reform, has 
been almost totally ignored. 
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It isn't hard to see why many of 
the people opposed to these laws have 
focused so closely on the First 
Amendment issue and its underlying 
principle of insulating the political 
process from religious factionalism. 
It is, after all, the fact that this insu­
lation has worn thin that has made 
the statutes possible. Preserving the 
"wall" between church and state is 
indeed a basic problem. But pur­
chase-of-secular-services agreements 
have educational consequences that 
are perhaps even more important. 

Ideally, these laws might prove a 
powerful force for equalization of ed­
ucational opportunity, for stimulation 
of wide experimentation in both 
public and nonpublic schools, and for 
development of new schools that will 
provide greater diver~ity in educa­
tion. But it appears that their effect 
will be just the opposite. 

Under the scheme provided for in 
the Pennsylvania and Rhode Island 
legislation, the State purchases, by 
contract with a nonpublic school and 
its employees, secular education for 
students in such schools. The contract 
usually calls for payment of part of 
the salary of certain lay teachers and 
for texts and other teaching materi­
als, as well as for the costs of stand­
ardized testing. The secularity and 
public purposes of these services is 
thought to be insured by limiting the 
instruction performed to that done by 
teachers of such courses as physical 
science, mathematics, or foreign lan­
guages. It is argued that these 
courses by their very nature cannot 
be tainted with religious doctrine. 

In deriving this theory of what 
constitutes secular ~ducation from the 
church-state decisions of the past 25 
yeaFs, it appears that questions of ed­
ucation policy were furthest from tlie 
minds of the drafters of these laws. 
In fact, one could take a much grim­
mer view, for aside from preserving 
the existing private schools, the effect 

of these laws will likely he to pres­
erve or make worse the already intol­
erable inequities and inadequacies of 
public schools, while restricting the 
capacity of the public, especially the 
poor and the minority groups, to find 
alternatives. 

This conclusion is substantiated by 
a review not only of the Pennsylvania 
and Rhode Island laws being tested 
but also of those passed in Connecti­
cut, Ohio, and Michigan, and of 
those pending in several other States. 
From the point of view of education 
reform, seven specific criteria are 
useful in evaluating this legislation: 
1) the level of aid provided; 2) the 
degree to which the aid equalizes the 
purchasing power of rich and poor; 
3) the degree to which the legislation 
would encourage uniformity rather 
than diversity of education pro­
grams; 4) the amount of due process 
available to recipients of aid who be­
lieve they have been unfairly treated; 
5) the extent to which the parents 
would be made cognizant that they 
had a choice among schools; 6) the 
amount of information about these 
schools that would be available to 
parents; and 7) the restrictions on 
racial discrimination in school admis­
sions. 

No State under these new aid laws 
pays enough to cover the cost of oper­
ating a private school. Rhode Island's 
law pays 15 percent of a teacher's 
salary. Pennsylvania pays "reasona­
ble cost" of certain teachers' salaries 
but reduces that amount to a prorata 
share in the inevitable event that le­
gitimate requests exceed legislative 
appropriations. Michigan begins by 
paying "not more than 50 percent" 
of the salaries of certified lay teach­
ers, and the story is basically the 
same in Ohio and Connecticut. The 
low level of aid is hardly an unex­
pected discovery, since it is the pur­
pose of this aid to maintain but not 
replace current private expenditures 

for education, and inasmuch as the 
secular education theory holds that 
the First Amendment can be satisfied 
if only part of the education in non­
public schools is paid for. 

The result of providing only incre­
mental aid is that only a few existing 
alternatives to public education can 
survive:-those with dependable ac­
cess to private financing-which is 
to say those serving the wealthy and 
institutions supported by religious or­
ganizations. The poor and middle 
class who do not desire religious edu­
cation and cannot afford to supple­
ment the small amount of State aid 
must fall back on the public schools, 
which will consequently become more 
segregated. The black community 
schools and the free schools serving 
mixed socio-economic and racial 
groups will be squeezed out. The re­
sult is free choice for those with 
access to private wealth and compul­
sory miseducation for the rest. 

Nor is there any prospect for the 
disappearance of this bias in the long 
run. The economic and political le­
verage of the affiuent and the sup­
porters of church schools, which led 
to the laws in the first place, will be 
maintained because the aid continues 
the existence of their schools. The 
poor and the middle class in general, 
lacking any basic economic or politi­
cal franchise for education, find no 
place to take hold. State education 
budgets will be fought out between 
those who have a vested interest in 
increased expenditures for public 
schools and those who have a vested 
interest in limiting public school 
financing, while maintaining a mod­
est level of aid to private schools. 

Some of the existing State laws at­
tempt to minimize these problems by 
devising aid formulas designed to put 
the poor in a somewhat better bar­
gaining position. Connecticut, for in­
stance, increases its 20 percent con­
tribution to a teacher's salary to 50 
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percent if the school enrolls one-third 
disadvantaged children, and to 60 
percent if it enrolls two-thirds disad­
vantaged children. While this pro­
vides an inducement to private 
schools to include disadvantaged chil­
dren, it does not change the funda­
mental bargaining position of poor 
parents, because they must still de­
pend on money provided by either 
higher income parents or the church 
to subsidize their children's educa­
tion. 

Pennsylvania approaches the equal­
ization of economic power for all 
parents ·by providing • for payment 
of actual cost of teacher salaries. 
This does not prevent the private 
school from increasing tuition to the 
point where the poor are priced out 
of the market, but it does at least 
make it possible for the poor or mid­
dl~ class to go to a· school without 
much outside :financing.'Nevertheless, 
this possibility is largely a chimera 
because the law's prorata sharing 
provision means that only a fraction 
of the actual cost of salaries will be 
paid. Thus, neither the Connecticut 
pliJi, which also honors first those 
claims based on the presence of dis­
advantaged children, nor Pennsylvan­
ia's, with its prorated half~promise to 
pay all instructional costs, really pro­
vides independence and effective 
choice to all parents. Rhode Island's 
statute, wliich provides a flat reim­
bursement of only 15 percent of 
teachers' salaries, is even worse on 
this score'.'Even thos; States, such a~ 
Illinois and Wisconsin: that are con­
sidering per capita grants instead of 
purchase of secular services fail to 
equalize substantially the bargaining 
power of all parents. 

Diversity is also forestalled by 
State.-imposed restrictions on how 
money can be spent. Some of these 
restrictions, of course, are designed 
to get around First Amendment prob­
lems by limiting the aid to subjects 
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thought to he free of religious con­
tent or over-tones. But such specific 
restrictions also apply to secular 
schools-though they needn't-with 
the result that the absolute minimum 
is done to encourage secul~r alterna­
tives to existing systems. In fact, this 
merely hints at the legislature's 
policy of discouraging diversity 
wherever possible. Ohio is the most 
blatant example. There, the aid law 
1) requires that private school teach­
ers must hold State certificates; 2) 
permits the State superintendent to 
review courses, teacher and student 
evaluations, and test ifoores; 3) pro­
hibits the use of services, materials, 
or programs not available in the 
public schools; and 4) sta!es ~at ed­
ucation in nonpublic schools "shall 
not exceed in cost or q'ualitr." that 
offered fa. the ·public ..schools (-empha­
sis added). 

Not all the statutes are so consider­
ate of the sensibilities of the public 
schqol bureaucracy ur so overtly an­
ticompetitive, but it, is· common to 
find provisions in the aid laws :r;e-· 
quiring teacher ceiti;fication, satisfac­
tory performance ori standardized 
testing, State approval of texts and' 
teaching inateria:ls, anil gene:r;al equi­
valency with tlie puplfo· school curric­
ulum, not to nientfoij coinplia~ce 
with building 'and .health codes and 
narrowly conceived attendance re­
quirements. l'he degree to which the 
States feel free to call .tthf; tune is 

already out of propori;ron:. to the . ~ . 

amounts tliey .are willing to 'pay the 
piper. While.:µiere js only enough aid 
to .sifstain, established private schools, -
there i,s enpugh ,regulation to hamper ' 
t4e. developri;tent of ·most exp~rimen-
tal ·schools. •• ' 

Although failure to con:i'ply with 
~"" thes~ fequirements cari result in ter.­

mination or denial.✓of 0-aid, "only the 
Connecticut,. !;itatute provides ..for 
notice of such State action and hear-

ing procedures through which a 
school can argue its case. Nor do 
those States that set minimum stand­
ards guarantee that schools meeting 
those standards will receive a fair 
share of the available aid. Pennsyl­
vania, in addition to several vague 
regulations, grants the State superin­
tendent of public instruction author­
ity 'to "establish rules and regulations 
pertaining" to payment. The oppor­
tunities for arbitrary treatment at the 
hands of State officials are apparent, 
particularly when one considers the 
heterodox and even radical stance 
taken by .many alternative schools. 
The absence of significant procedural 
due process, in four of the five laws 
in other States, is not reassuring. 

The formulas for the purchase of 
secular services dilute the effective­
·ness...of parent- choice even among 
private schools receiving aid. In most 
cases, the teacher or school receives 
the aid directly, regardless of the 
number or type of children in the 
school or class, and the money would 
continue to come in even if a large 
number of parents abandoned the 
school. The school would, of course, 
lose the tuition these parents were 
paying. While the connection between 
parent choice and economic survival 
is not severed, it is substantially 
weakened. 

The new aid laws also deny par­
ents the means to influence the poli­
cies of·the schools they choose for 
their cliildren, and none of the· laws 
provides-for informing parents of the 
na~i;e of the alternatives open to 
them. Systematic dissemination of 
basic infcirmation is essential to a 
consumer OJ'. democratic political sys­
~em, btit, aside from the guarantee 
that schools meet dubious State 
standards, these la~~ have not seen 
fit to encou.rage informed ch.ci'ice. In 
:=1dtlition to t4e other bars to diver­
sity, none of the plans makes any 
provision for: aiqing or encouraging 

the start of new schools, for instance, 
through technical assistance or low­
cost loans. Indeed, the Connecticut 
purchase-of-services law requires that 
a school either be in operation prior 
to the passage of the act or file a 
statement of intent to operate as a 
.s<r,4.~ol 3 years before applying for 
aid. 

The consequences of these bills­
their failure to support adequately 
secular, non-elitist schools, their fail­
ure to equalize the bargaining posi­
tion of the poor and middle class, 
their failure to foster competition 
and diversity, and their failure to 
provide for signifi,cant influence by 
parents-tend f?imply to extend and 
reproduce ali the failures of the 
public scho<;>ls. They are indeed un­
fortunate consequences, but one fur­
ther consegnence-of·these laws is in­
tolerable; the lack of effective bar­
riers to prevent racial discrimination. 

Almost all require a certificate of 
compliance with Title VI of the .Civil 
Rights Act of 1964, but certificates 
are easy to sign, and only Connecti­
cut provides for any enforcement 
procedure. It is reasonable to assume 
·that at some point the Supreme Court 
will extend 14th Amendment safe­
guards against racial discrimination 
to schools receiving this comprehen­
sive State aid. But this could mean 
nothing more than that the whole te­
dious process that started with the 
public schools in 1954 must he gone 
through again with private schools. 
In light of this and the obvious en­
forcement problems engendered by a 
large number of independent schools, 
it is quite likely that because of the 
absence of specific standards and 
grievance procedures, the overall ef­
fect of these hills will he the further 
segregation of public schools, an ef• 
feet that might reasonably he consid­
ered de jure segregation because of 
the method of its accomplishment. 
During the recent trial of a Conp.ecti-
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cut suit challenging the State's pur­
chase-of-services plan, considerable 
evidence of these segregation prob­
lems was presented. 

These disastrous purchase-of-secu­
lar-services plans seem to have 
gained political support in part be­
cause no alternative way of aiding 
nonpublic schools has been regarded 
as feasible. However, a recent study 
commissioned by the Office of Eco­
nomic Opportunity (OEO) demon­
strates that an education voucher 
plan is not only a feasible alternative 
but that for the poor, for minority 
groups, for educational pluralism, 
and for the general health of Ameri­
can education vouchers would he pre­
ferable. 

The report to OEO recommends an 
experiment of 5 to 8 years in dura­
tion. Parents of school-age children 
in the experimental area would re­
ceive vouchers approximately equal 
to the average per-pupil expenditures 
public schools had previously main­
tained. For parents of educationally 
disadvantaged children the value of 
the voucher would he increased, per­
haps to as high as twice the basic 
amount. Students could attend any 
approved school, whether operated 
by a public or private authority. 
Regulations of approved schools 
would remain about as they are now, 
securing a minimum basic education 
hut placing no premium on uniform­
ity. Admissions to oversubscribed 
schools would he conducted by lot 
for 50 percent of the places, with the 
school choosing the other 50 percent, 
provided it did not discriminate on 
the basis of race. Systematic informa­
tion about schools would be collected 
and published by a local Education 
Voucher Agency (EVA) that would 
administer the entire experiment. 

The proposed experimental 
voucher plan seeks to meet each of 
the objections raised in discussing 
purchase of secular services. It does 

not divide the electorate into those 
favoring increased public school 
funds and those seeking to divert 
public funds to private schools, be­
cause every child's education is paid 
for by voucher, regardless of which 
school he attends. The level of sup­
port is adequate to meet all opera­
tional costs of running a school, elim­
inating the need to rely upon private 
funding with its inherently discrimi­
natory effects. Aid is delivered per 
capita and is skewed in favor of the 
poor and working classes, providing 
significant bargaining power to those 
in low-income brackets and incen­
tives to schools to enroll disadvan­
taged children. Diversity is aided by 
relying for education standards on 
the State minimums that already gov­
ern a wide range of private schools. 
Furthermore, since the insulation of 
church and state is accomplished by 
creating a system that, similar to the 
one in the GI Bill, substitutes the in­
dividual for the State in. deciding 
which schools receive aid, no com­
plex of secularizing regulations is 
needed. The plan is carefully de­
signed to provide school data suffi­
cient to allow an informed choice by 
parents. Finally, the lottery provi­
sions and the provision of free trans­
portation for students provide a relia­
ble protection against racial discrimi­
nation. 

Although the Court will not be 
passing upon any form of vouchers 
in Lemon and DiCenso, the compari­
son is certainly instructive on educa­
tional, economic, and racial issues. 
The purchase-of-secular-services legis­
lation that the Court will be testing 
this fall responds to two needs: sav­
ing the public treasury from the ex­
pense of educating erstwhile pa­
rochial school students; and· avoiding 
the constraints of the First Amend­
ment's church-state provisions. But 
this particular form of meeting these 
needs only creates further problems. 

In order to save ourselves a few dol­
lars, we will hamstring an incipient 
educational reform movement based 
on educational and cultural diversity 
and racial and economic equality. To 
prevent an entanglement of church 
and state, we will create a bureauc­
racy and a set of regulations that will 
hamper the education experiments we 
must have if we are to find out how 
best to dismantle the schooling mono­
lith we are locked into. The narrow­
ness of the concerns expressed by 
those who favor or oppose these bills 
will be partly to blame. 

In this context, it makes little sense 
to rely, politically or constitutionally, 
solely on arguments based on separa­
tion of church and state. The most 
important question is not whether 
private schools should receive aid-it 
seems clear that one way or another 
they will-but whether a way can be 
found to provide that aid and simul­
taneously advance the reform of our 
whole system of education. The 
recent flurry of discussion about tui­
tion vouchers at least represents an 
attempt to view these problems to­
gether and come up with a compre­
hensive solution to all of them. If the 
Court finds the purchase-of-services 
theory unconstitutional, it is likely 
that the energy behind those laws will 
be put into some form of voucher 
plan that makes the parent the deter­
minant of which schools will be 
aided. If the Court finds the present 
aid plans acceptable, there will be a 
rush of State legislation duplicating 
these plans all over the country, and 
one promising means of converting 
the financial crisis in private educa­
tion into a force for broad educa­
tional reform will have been lost. 

STEPHEN ARONS 

Mr. Arons is staff attorney at the Center 
for Law and Education at Harvard. This 
article is reprinted, with permission, from 
the January 16, 1971 issue of Saturday 
Review. 
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Taking the 
MAMMY 

out or 
housework 

In today's world, the term "household employment" 
has become synonymous with "degradation". It is not 
a new analogy hut it has become the basis for demand 
for change-change which will permit the household 
worker to take her place beside trained and respected 
professionals in all other avenues of human endeavor. 

Prior to the Civil War, household work was tradi­
tionally performed by black women for white women. 
Since the Civil War, the situation has been essentially 
the same. The only difference is that, since 1865, the 
white woman has hot held legal title to her worker. 

According to U.S. Department of Labor figures, 
two-thirds of the female household workers are black 
with the remaining third listed as white, which in­
cludes American Indians, Mexican Americans, and 
other minorities. 

It is still the rule, though, for the housewife to refer 
to her employee as her "girl" or "help". The worker is 
still known as a "maid",. addressed by her first name, 
expected to address her employer and other white 
women as "ma'am" and subjected to a variety of 
personal and often patronizing questions. 

In the experience of a middle-aged household worker 
from Philadelphia: "I have been on quite a few jobs 
where I have been called 'my girl', and this I resent 
very highly. If their children are home from school 
you call them 'Mister' or 'Miss'. But you're still 'my 
girl' and it's 'Mary Jane, come here and do this.'" 

According to the Department of Labor, the number 
of women willing to clean other people's houses for a 
living is dwindling. During the 1960's, household 
workers in America declined by approximately 
900,000 to 1.6 million. 
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At the very time that the supply has decreased, the 
demand for household workers has increased. America 
as a whole is becoming more aflluent, and freedom 
from housework has long been both a benefit and 
symbol of wealth. In addition, the return to the labor 
force of many "liberated" middle and upper income 
housewives has created the need for more professional 
household services. 

Statistics tell much of the story. The Department of 
Labor reports that the median wage for full-time, 
year-round female household workers 1n 1968 was 
$1,523. Eighty-two percent had total cash incomes 
under $2,000 per year. If there is any question about 
the inadequacy of these earnings, it should he noted 
that almost two-thirds of these women are single, wid­
owed, divorced, or separated, and therefore at least 
partly self-supporting. Approximately 200,000 are the 

head of a family, supporting children or other adults 
as well as themselves. 

An adequate wage level is a prerequisite for attract­
ing more women to household work. It is by no means, 
however, the entire solution. Household employees are 
exempt from most national and local protective labor 
legislation. Unemployment and workmen's compensa­
tion, as well as minimum wage protection, are virtually 
nonexistent. The fringe benefits long ago taken for 
granted by most other American workers are still de­
nied household employees. Very few receive paid holi­
days, vacations, or sick leave, not to mention hospitali­
zation benefits or retirement plans. A change in the 
laws affecting household workers would help, hut this, 
too, is not the entire answer. 

The solution lies in a complete restructuring and 
redefinition of hired housework. This is necessary he-
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cause the manner in which household employer-em­
ployee relations are conducted today is one of the most 
dysfunctional and anachronistic practices in America. 

Mechanization has eliminated many of the most dif­
ficult and unpleasant jobs in housework. Few women 
will deny that such work is physically exhausting and 
mentally unrewarding. Yet the mop and rag are still 
the basic tools of this trade. 

In no other industry is the modern day worker so 
completely at the mercy of her employer. What can a 
worker do when the woman she normally works for 
once a weeks calls that morning and says it is not 
convenient to have her that day? She is strand~d­
without pay, of course! To whom can a worker appeal 
when her employer decides to "bargain down" the 
pay rate previously accepted? What can an employee 
do when each of the six housewives who employ her 
every week tells her to go about her job in a different 
manner? 

A household worker from Canton, Ohio praised one 
of her exceptional employers: "I have one lady who 
paid me one vacation for that one particular day. She 
travelled across to the West Coast and she paid me for 
that day that I lost. The rest of them go to Europe, the 
Bahamas, any place they want to, and if you are • off 
you are just off." A worker from Youngstown, Ohio 
described her similar experiences: "Recently my little 
boy was sick, and I took a week off and told my 
employer that I wouldn't be in until the following 
Monday. When I went back she didn't like it so she 
didn't pay me for a week. My little boy is more impor­
tant to me than the job." 

The employer clearly has the upper hand. An em­
ployee usually works by herself and has no collective 
strength with which to bargain. Further, should the 
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worker lose her job or find a particular housewife 
intolerable, she stands to forfeit preciously needed 
income. The most the employer will suffer is a few 
more days of dusty furniture .before she finds a re­
placement or does the work herself. 

The household worker finds that she is treated as a 
third-class citizen not only on the job and in the 
legislatures, but merely on her way to and from work 
every day. Seventy-four percent of female household 
workers are employed in urban areas. Nine out of ten 
do "day work" rather than "live in". These women 
often spend several hours a day commuting to and 
from work by public transportation. If the bus com­
pany fails to keep its schedule, a worker may lose an 
hour or a day of pay. She runs the risk of scheduling 
in foul weather, or of having her purse snatched on 
the way home from the bus stop at night. 

A worker from the Midwest explained that the bus 
she rides out to the suburbs in the morning must cross 
the main railroad tracks. "Early in the morning when 
the big trains are coming there have been times when I 
had to wait. When I get to work my employer says, 
'How come you can't get here?' Well, I can't get out of 
the bus and hop over a freight train to get to work by 
8:30." 

There are indications that the drop in the number of 
household workers is partly due to the lack of young 
entrants into the field. Labor Department statistics 
show a median age of 4,6 for female household work­
ers. Whites, who traditionally are more upwardly mo­
bile, have a median age of 53. For blacks it is 43. 

The young women who formerly had no choice but 
to become household workers are discovering more 
attractive alternatives. Other industries and occupa­
tions are opening their doors to the members of disad­
vantaged ethnic minorities. In addition, it is now pos­
sible in certain instances for a woman to stay home 
with her children and earn as much money as she 
would if she did housework at the prevailing rate. 

There is a solution to this dilemma. Various ap­
proaches to solving the household problem have been 
tested for six years by the National Committee on 
Household Employment (NCHE). The Committee is a 
private nonprofit organization first funded by the 
Labor Department and now by a grant from the Ford 
Foundation. Initially it had as its goals: to improve 
working conditions for household workers; to improve 
and put the quality of services on a professional basis; 
and to increase the number of workers in this occupa­
tion. Today the emphasis is on wages and working 
conditions. 
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In cooperation with the Department of Labor, the 
Committee in its initial testing administered eight 
model projects which employed differing means of at­
tracting more and better workers to the household 
service industry. Among the cities chosen for the 
projects were New York, Chicago, and Boston. 

The most successful model has been the intermedi­
ary household service firm. This company employs 
household workers and in turn offers standardized 
services to the public. 

Froµi the housewife's point of view, the primary 
advantage of this increasingly popular arrangement is 
the firm's guarantee of satisfactory job performance. 
She is also relieved of her legal responsibilities as an 
employer, although laws requiring deductions and con­
tributions by household employers are difficult to en­
force and apparently rarely obeyed. 

For the worker, improvements include all the fringe 
benefits not available in the traditional situation where 
the employer is a housewife or family. These include 
paid sick leaves, holidays, and vacations. Other advan­
tages include a more consistent, predictable work 
schedule, pay which meets local requirements for a 
decent standard of living, and the possibility of promo­
tion to supervisory positions. 

Both parties benefit from the company's ability to 
act as a neutral third party, enforcing reasonable and 
uniform job standards. Further, these firms are the 
best equipped to increase worker productivity. This 
appears to be a key to higher earnings because the 
price most familirs will pay for a clean house is defi­
nitely limited. If, through the use of modern machin­
ery and techniques, a woman can clean three houses a 
day at $12 each, she will significantly increase her 
present income. Either way the customer gets a clean 
house. 

There are two variations of the intermediary house­
hold firm. It can be owned by an individual or corpo­
ration composed of investors. Or it can be operated as 
a cooperative. Experience to date indicates that wide­
spread use of the cooperative model would be prema­
ture. By definition the management of a co-op is more 
complex than a corporation or a proprietary business. 
At present the firms in this industry are encountering 
their share of ordinary business-related problems. 
Management by the employees might easily prove fa­
tally cumbersome. 

The NCHE, in testing the various approaches to 
solving the problems confronting those now employed 
as household workers, has conducted and participated 
in workshops and seminars in various parts of the 

country. NCHE has assisted in the establishment of 
self-sustaining privately or cooperatively-owned enter­
prises which provide standardized household services 
to the public. 

Among the booklets and pamphlets published by the 
Committee in developing various means by which com­
munities can participate is "Improving the Status of 
Household Employment: A Handbook for Community 
Action." 

In the NCHE's efforts to promote positive attitudes 
toward household workers on the part of employers 
and the community, it has set forth guidelines for 
sensitizing employers to the needs and the position of 
household workers. "Sensitizing" sessions have been 
held by community personnel dramatizing simulated 
situations of what is occurring between employee and 
employer. In addressing itself to employee-employer 
relationships, the National Committee on Household 
Employment established a "Code of Standards" to be 
adhered to by both parties. 

The problems confronting household workers and 
their employers are long-term in nature. It is to he 
expected, then, that the solutions will require time 
and patience to implement. The traditional attitudes 
held about household employees by housewives, law­
makers, and other important segments of American 
society will change appreciably only when the house­
hold employees have become less dependent on the 
"charity" of their employers. It is this precise "per­
sonal'' aspect of the existing relationship that must be 
eliminated if the industry is to develop potential for 
employees, both financially and psychologically. In 
principle the widespread establishment of household 
service firms provides an excellent solution. In practice 
the results are encouraging but still inconclusive due 
to the short duration of the experiments and the rela­
tively small sample. 

NCHE is continuing its experimental work and is 
currently implementing a program of financial and 
technical assistance to household service firms in Little 
Rock, Arkansas; Buffalo, New York; Alexandria, Vir­
ginia; and the District• of Columbia. It is felt that 
experience with these and perhaps several additional 
firms, considered in light of what was learned by ear­
lier projects, will provide a clear picture of whether 
household service firms are a solution, and, if so, under 
what conditions. 

DARRY A. SRAGOW 

Mr. Sragow is Communications Officer for the National Com­
mittee on Household Employment. 
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NATIONAL COMMITTEE ON 
HOUSEHOLD EMPLOYMENT 
CODE OF STANDARDS IN 
HOUSEHOLD 
EMPLOYER-EMPLOYE.E WORK 

• Schedules should be agreed upon in advance of 
employment. 

• If an employer does not require the services of a 
dayworker for the agreed upon time or times,. the 
employee must be notified at least a week in 
advance or be compensated in full by the em­
ployer, 

• The employee has the responsibility of notifying 
her employer as soon as possible if she is unable 
to report to work. 

• A written agreement between employer and em­
ployee should clearly define the duties of the po­
sition, including specific tasks, frequency, and de­
sired standards. 

• Promptness, integrity, and courtesy should be ob­
served by both parties. 

• Efficient, safe, and workable appliances and clean­
ing aids should be provided and used carefully. 

• Adequate provisions for maximum safety and 
health should be maintained at all times. 

• Rest periods, meal times, telephone privileges, 
and time out for private activities (such as 
church attendance for live-in employees) should 
he agreed upon in advance of employment. 

• Work and work relationships should be periodi­
cally discussed with the intent of improving 
efficiency and understanding. Constructive and 
helpful evaluations of work should be encour­
aged. 

• Pleasant and private quarters should be provided 
for live-in employees. 

• A professional working relationship should be 
maintained by both parties. This includes appro­
priate and courteous forms of address for both 
employee and employer and their respective fami­
lies. 

FACTS AND FIGURES ON 
HOUSEHOLD EMPLOYMENT* 

As of 1968, women in ·household employment total 
almost 1,700,000. 
Fifteen percent of private household workers head 
more than 250,000 families. 
Household workers are not covered by the Federal 
minimum wage and hour law. 
The following figures are for the 1.4 million women 
who reported their occupations as dayworkers, house­
keepers, maids, and laundresses, but excluded babysit­
ters, in 1960: 

Median annual wage _________________ $1,297 
Total cash income 

87 percent of household workers 
under $2,000 

61 percent of household workers 
under $1,000 

Marital status of household workers 

Single --------------------------- 36% 
Married -------------------------- 34% 
Widowed, divorced, or separated _____ 30% 

Educational attainment of household workers 
Less than five years ________________ 10.9% 
High school completed _____________ 20.4% 

Some college --------------------- 3.8% 
Geographical distribution 

Southern States ___________________ 54% 
Northeastern States ______________ over 19% 
North Central States ---· ___________ 18% 
Western States ____________________ 9% 
Urban areas _____________________ 74% 
Rural non-farm areas ______________ 21 % 
Rural farm areas __________________ 5% 

Live-in workers ------------------- 11% 
Race 

Black --------------------------- 64% 
White 
(including Mexican Americans) _____ 35% 
Other nonwhites __________________ 1% 

Age of household workers 
45 and over----------------------- 53% 
Over 55 -------------------------- 29% 
Over 65 -------------------------- 10% 
Median age of all private 
household workers _______________ 46 years 

~The figures listed here were taken 'from "Women Private 
Household Workers Fact Sheet," July 1969, published by 
the Women's Bureau, U. S. Department of Labor. 
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The Campus and the Racial Crisis, 
edited by David C. Nichols and Olive 
Mills. Washington, D.C.: American 
Council on Education, 1970. 309 pp. 

A collection of 44 essays by faculty 
members, trustees, administrators, stu­
dents, public officials, and others who 
affirm that there is a racial crisis on 
campus and it has come about as part 
of the crisis in the larger society. While 
the vantage points and perceptions of 
the contributors differ markedly, all of 
them share a sense of involvement and 
a desire to further the kinds of changes 
needed to effect improvements. 

The Economics of -the Ghetto, by 
Carolyn Shaw Bell. New York: Pegasus, 
1970. 266 pp. 

An introduction to the economics of the 
ghetto in which the author uses illus­
trative material about three cities in the 
United States and three neighborhoods 
wit~in each to demonstrate how employ­
ment, wages, prices, rents, housing, and 
consumption differ inside the ghetto at 
every level of income. Describes the con­
ditions which exist in the ghettos, their 
implications, and discusses what can be 
done about these conditions. 

Educating the Mexican American, by 
Henry Sioux Johnson and William J. 
Hernandez-M. Valley Forge, Pa.: Jud­
son Press, 1970. 384 pp. 

An introductory bo!)k of readings de­
signed to provide a vast array of hither­
to unpublished contemporary materials 
on the educalional dilemma of Mexican 
Americans in the Southwest. In 34 arti­
cles,. leading Mexican American educa-

tors present their diagnoses and theories 
for change in the schools' curricular 
offerings, with emphasis on bilingual 
and biculiural programs for all students 
in the public and private schools of the 
Southwest. 

Government Against Poverty, by Joseph 
A. Kershaw with the assistance of Paul 
N. Courant. Washington, D.C.: Brook­
ings Institution, 1970. 174 pp. 
An account of Government efforts on be­
half of the poor since the declaration of 
"unconditional war on poverty"-efforts 
made through the Office of Economic 
Opportunity and other programs. Ex­
amines the history and purposes of 
domestic antipoverty programs in an 
effort to explain why the problem of 
poverty in the Nation is still far from 
solved. The author concludes that de­
spite some early success, antipoverty 
programs have been stymied by inade­
quate Federal support. 

jGrito! Reies Tijerina and the New 
Mexico Land Grant War of 1967, by 
Richard Gardner. Indianapolis: Bobbs­
Merrill Company, Inc., 1970. 292 pp. 

An account of the courthouse raid in 
1967 by a small group of Spanish 
Americans to publicize their claim that 
much of the land in the State had been 
stolen from their ancestors. Documents 
the history of the land-grant controversy 
and the role of Reies Tijerina-an 
evangelical preacher and avowed leader 
of the Spanish Americans in the South­
west. 

The Negro and the City, edited by Rich­
ard B. Sherman. Englewood Cliffs, N.J.: 
Prentice-Hall, Inc., 1970. 182 pp. 

Describes the experience of black Amer­
icans-their hopes, their problems, their 
reactions-in the city from the late 
19th century to the present day. 
Selections from the works of Booker T. 
Washington, W.E.B. DuBois, Kenneth 
B. Clark, etc. illustrate the exciting as 
well as the discouraging aspects of black 
urbanization. 

A Single Society: Alternatives to Urban 
Apartheid, by Donald Canty. New York: 
Praeger Publishers, 1969. 181 pp. 

Reviews the past decade in which civil 
disorders steadily escalated in spite of 
progressive programs. Traces the rise of 
black pride, white resistance, and the 

continuing lag in national response to 
urban needs. The author proclaims the 
need for a national will to achieve the 
ultimate goal-a single society-diverse 
in its people, unified in spirit. The al­
ternative is urban apartheid. 

Studies and Reports 

Campus Unrest. The report of the Presi­
dent's Commission on Campus Unrest. 
Washington, D.C.: U.S. Government 
Printing Office, 1970. 537 pp. 

Civil Rights: Progress Report 1970. 
Congressional Quarterly, Inc. Washing­
ton, D.C. 1971. 92 pp. 

The Education of the Minority Child: 
A Comprehensive Bibliography of 10,-
000 Selected Entries, compiled by Meyer 
Weinberg. Chicago: Integrated Educa­
tion Associates, 1970. 530 pp. 

Federal Agencies and Black Colleges, 
Fiscal Year 1969. Revised January 1971. 
Federal Interagency Committee on Edu­
cation. Washington, D.C.: U.S. Govern­
ment Printing Office, 1971. 49 pp. 

A New Era: The Spanish Speaking 
People of the United States. Cabinet 
Committee on Opportunities for Spanish 
Speaking People. Fall 1970. Washing­
ton, D.C.: U.S. Government Printing 
Office, 1970. 24 pp. 

Report to the President on Minority 
Business Enterprise, from Maurice H. 
Stans, Secretary of Commerce. June 30, 
1970. Washington, D.C.: U.S. Dept. of 
Commerce, 1970. 

The Social Consequences of Residential 
Segregation of the Urban American 
Negro, by Stephen D. Berger. March 
1970. New York: Metropolitan Applied 
Research Center, 1970. 68 pp. 

Study of Minority Group Employment 
in the Federal Government. November 
30, 1969. Prepared by U.S. Civil Service 
Commission. Washington, D.C.: U.S. 
Government Printing Office, 1970. 644 
pp. 

Who Are the Urban Poor?, by Anthony 
Downs. Revised edition. New York: 
Committee for Economic Development, 
1970. 64 pp. 
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RADICAL ·CHIC & MAU.;;MAUING THE 
FLAK CATCHERS 
By Tom Wolfe 

Farrar, Straus & Giroux. 153 pages. 1970. 

"I see white teeth in a black face. 
I see black eyes in a white face. 
Help us to see persons, Jesus-not a black person, 
or a white person, a red person or a yellow person, 
but human persons." 

(Malcolm Boyd) 

That's a pretty simple, black-and-white type of 
poem, right? And it's good! I mean, what it says is 
boldly American, true to what this country stands 
for. "We hold these truths to be self evident ... 
are created equal ..." Right? Well, why the hell 
does it make any difference to some of us? For 
Christ's sake, why does it? Why do people still get 
their backs up about this color bit? That's partly 
what Tom Wolfe's new book is all about. Color. Not 
the TV kind or Technicolor but the kind that makes 
you different from me or Leonard Bernstein or Don 
Cox. The permanent, Coppertone type. 

The subject matter of the book is serious, just 
like the Civil War was serious. But you will hardly 
be able to read a single page without laughing, 
because it's also an exceptionally funny hook. And 
that's one of the reasons I think it's so important. 
Wolfe's treatment of today's racial seriousness is all 

the more amusing and relevant because it humili­
ates and degrades everyone concerned, and his un­
usual but honest approach shows us the ludicrous, 
confused ditch we all sometimes find ourselves in. 

The book consists of two long essays, closely 
related in theme and substance, both dealing with 
political stances and social styles in our status­
minded world. The Leonard Bernsteins' "party" for 
the Panther 21 and the troubles of California anti­
poverty offices play variations on a serious theme, 
the dynamics of confrontation between oppressed 
"colored" peoples and the well-intentioned white­
America privileged. 

"Radical Chic," the first and- longest of the two 
essays, "describes" the bash that took place on the 
night of January 4, 1970 in the thirteen-room Park 
Avenue pad of Mr. and Mrs. Leonard Bernstein. 
The purpose of the gathering was so that some of 
New York's socially elite could meet spokesmen of 
the Black Panther Party, hear them out, and talk 
over ways of aiding their cause. Wolfe presents the 
psychodynamics of the black-white, oppressed-privi­
leged confrontation and recreates the incongruous 
scene in an honest, unserious fashion, yet with just 
enough ugliness to make his point. Poor Leonard. 
He and all those other well-intentioned "Radical 
Chic" whose motives were undoubtedly as pure and 
guileless as those of Candide. They really wanted 
to understand. It was a "meeting," not a "party." 
There just happened to be gold, silk, booze, canapes 
and servants. Bnt the servants were white; not 
black. That's important. At least the Park Avenue 
inhabitants thought it was. But that's what Wolfe 
believes is their whole problem. Their thinking, 
their reasoning. Their attempt to almost "be" black, 
and yet never for a second losing sight of their 
status. Why did they insist on concentrating their 
energies on this color difference in the first place? 
Does having a meeting in your Penthouse mean 
that sharing your comforts with the oppressed has 
now eliminated the incongruity that existed before 
the first guest arrived? No way! I think Wolfe is 
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"Oh, dear me-it's my sister's party you want. I'm 
still a conservative." 

(Reproduced by special permission of PLAYBOY Magazine. Copy.
right © 1970 PLAYBOY) 

saying that, if anything, the Panthers and groups 
like them are only demeaned by such occasions. 
While the Chic, having done their "good deed" for 
the night, go home feeling like Boy Scouts. 

"Mau-Mauing the Flak Catchers," the shorter 
piece, asks the reader to survey another meeting­
ground betw~en militant minorities and the liberal 
white establishment. In this essay Wolfe suggests 
that antipoverty programs, which assume that as­
sistance is productive only if funneled through ex­
isting ghetto power-structures (gangs), actually 
create fictitious power-structures. "Mau-Mauing" is 
the ethnic term for confrontation politics ( the old 
arm-twisting hit), and the Flak Catchers are the 
Civil Services "lifers" who work in their local 
offices and try the best they can to cope with the 
everyday abuses of the poverty programs. Wolfe is 
objective, empathetic and witty. He describes in de­
tail the techniques developed by young blacks, Chi­
canos, Filipinos, Chinese, Indians, and even Sa-

- moans in their relations with the bureaucracy that 
grew ~p in and around the poverty program. The 
points brought up are valid, and the reader will find 
himself laughing while at the same time cringing 
because it's all probably true. I don't think his 
.description of this type of racial confrontation is as 

effective as "Radical Chic," but the insights cer­
tainly are there. 

As I mentioned before, I do believe one should 
expose himself to this new piece of literature. It is 
valuable because it forces you to ask, "Why?" And 
the seriousness isn't so painful to take, because Tom 
Wolfe is still one of the best satirists we have 
around. The topics are important, but that's where 
I, personally, ran into a hang-up. I guess I just 
really want to stop discussing colors and talk about 
persons. But what Wolfe is trying to say is that 
we're not at that stage yet. We still have people 
around who believe, and they really do, that theire 
better than others because of the color of their skin. 

"Better than other people." Sometimes he says: 
"That, at least, you are." But m.ore often: "Why 
should you be?° Either you are what you can be, 
or you are not-like other people." 

(Dag Hammarskjold-"Markings") 

DENNIS LEE SALVARYN 

Mr. Salvaryn is a Lieutenant (j.g.) in the Navy on a leave 
of absence from the world of drama. He has produced and 
directed theatrical productions in Southern California. 
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Mexican Americans in School: A History of 
Educational Neglect 

by Thomas P. Carter 

New York: College Entrance Examination Board, 
1970. 235 pp. 

There should be no question that withdrawal 
from school and low academic achievement aptly 
describe the school behavior of vast numbers of 
Mexican Americans. In the past, the stereotype of 
the Mexican American, in all its foi;ms, has been 
used conveniently to explain such behavior. As Dr. 
c;arter points out: 

The circular nature of arguments commonly pre­
sented is obvious: Mexican Americans do poorly 
in school because they are poor, speak Spanish, 
and carry a traditional folk culture because they 
do poorly in school. 

In the first two chapters the author is able to 
i~entify the real problem as being the "dire social 
and economic situation of this ethnic group." Fur­
thermore he attacks the concept of cultural depriva­
tion as being akin to racism for assuming that 
deviation from the middle class standard constitutes 
a disadvantage or a deprivation. While rejecting 
such a concept Dr. Carter proceeds to discuss the 
reality of the situation which indicates that the 
closer a child's home and experiences are to the 
middle class norm, the higher his chances for 
success in school. The school goes about its business 
of acculturating and assimilating on the premise 
that ·the differences that the child brings to school 
are liabilities rather than assets. Large sums of 
Itioney are being spent on numerous programs to 
Itiake "those children" more like what the school 

I 

expects, and indeed, accepts. 

, The chapter on the Default of the School is qf 
particular importance for those who are blind to the 
needs that exist in the education of Mexican Ameri­
cans. It is a straight forward well documented ,de­
scription of the real world segregation, tracking 
and institutional bias in which the Mexican Ameri­
can student often exists. 

In discussing the Failure of the Culture the au­
thor presents many examples of cultural myths that 
lead teachers to stereotype their students and thus 
provide explanations for low school achievement. 
This chapter would provide an excellent point of 

departure for discussions by concerned educators 
who are interested in identifying some of the real 
problems-those within the institution itself. 

The description of programs currently being con­
ducted for Mexican American children and youth is 
candid and use£ul. The appraisal of the programs 
raises many questions which should be useful to 
administrators and other planners as they consider 
the educational needs of their children. 

Mexican Americans in School is probably the 
most straight forward and comprehensive discussion 
of the conditions that surround the education of 
Mexican Americans. It should be of value to all 
educators and lay persons alike who realize that a 
great need exists and that action is imperative. 

The one disappointing facet of an otherwise ex­
cellent book is its omission of a great force in the 
Mexican American's struggle for better education 
and for a better life in general. Perhaps Dr. Carter 
left out explicit reference to the Chicano movement 
for some good reason: however, it is imperative for 
educators, presumably the people for whom the 
book is intended, to understand that Chicano 
groups in their communities are probably the most 
important resource and force to help bring about 
needed change. 

It has been largely through the efforts of young 
people that Chicano studies programs have been 
initiated in colleges, high schools, and even at lower 
levels. Schools that have such programs have 
become much different places for students who now 
see themselves as being worthy individuals as they 
are, not as the school prescribes they should be. 

In many places throughout the Southwest there is 
a real difference in outlook and concern between 
those who prefer the label Mexican American or 
American of Mexican Descent and those who em­
brace Chicanismo. The latter are usually more 
forceful in seeking needed change in the educa­
tional system and view the qualities that the -Chi­
cano possesses as important enough to defy homog­
enization. By virtually omitting reference to Chi­
canos and contributions made by the movement, 
this book could provide solace for those who choose 
to listen to Mexican Americans but not to Chicanos. 

ERNESTO F. GARCIA 

Mr. Garcia is a Professor of Education at California State 
College, San Bernadino. 
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Gentlemen: 
I was pleased to read . . . [ excerpts of .From Chil­Commentary 

dren with Love* in the Summer 1970 Civil Rights 
Digest], for many [of the vignettes] demonstrated a 
sensitivity and an awareness which comes with a pro­
gram of quality integrated education. Others mani• 
fested a maturity of which children are capable if they 
are encouraged. 

I certainly understand and appreciate the contribu­
tion the program is making to those who take part. 
But beyond that, its success, as reflected in this small 
but revealing book, can be good example for our so­
ciety of what can be achieved when people are commit­
ted to providing a positive learning experience for all, 
and together. 

Kenneth B. Clark 
President, 
Metropolitan Applied Research Center, Inc. 
60 East 86th Street 
New York, New York 10028 

Editor's note: 'To complement Dr. Clark's letter, we asked the 
resource teacher on black studies who directed 
the development of From Children With Love to 
tell us how the hook came about. 

From Children With Love 
WORDS-Words-words. 

Words influence thoughts, alter actions, change 
lives. We know because recently we drew forth word 
talent from over 200 youngsters in 4th through 6th 
grades by means of a black studies program. 

Poems based on history, poems concerned with fa. 
mous black people, poems that borrowed titles from 
Langston Hughes, poems that discussed bused integra­
tion, and poems that expressed our children's dreams 
filled a 94-page anthology called From Children With 
Love. And one of the nicest things about it all was that 
until 2 weeks before press time the children never 
knew a poetry book was in the making. Every topic 
involved classroom teaching. 

Writing came after children read teacher-constructed 
biographies. These stories included sentences to meet 
everyone's reading range. From these same dittoed 
sheets children learned about verbs, ,nouns, adjectives, 
and interpreted people and events in crayon and paint. 
They also discussed newspaper articles and the bt:ising 

*From Children With Love, by 200 children of Columbus Inter­
mediate School, Berkeley Unified School District, Superior 
Press, Oakland, California, 1969-70. 94 pp. 
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problems which were happening elsewhere. 
Children listened to excerpts from the Autobiogra­

phy of Malcolm X and acted out or sketched picture 
summaries of a favorite scene. His Halloween Eve 
prank and his years in jail were popular subjects. 
Malcolm X's childhood appealed to all youngsters. 
White children, awakened to how others may be forced 
to live, drew closer to other classmates. Black children 
listened in awed silence as another's life, perhaps simi­
lar to their own, unfolded. 

The children also heard teacher renditions of 25 
poems by Langston Hughes or listened to the poet's 
voice on record before trying their own hand at such 
titles as Snail, Heaven, and Kid in the Park. 

A "Trick or Treat" bulletin board, timed for Hal­
loween, started scurried action to source books-Great 
Negroes: Past and Present. The Pictorial History of 
the American Negro, and Famous American Negroes. 
Classes that turned in two to four line poems which 
correctly identified 30 personalities were "treated" to 
bags of candy. Children couldn't understand how all 
five classes won-but the contest never required com­
plete class participation. If more than half had contrib­
uted to the assignment, everyone received a candy 
reward. 

Berkeley, as a 2-year bused school community of 
over 100,000 people, is unique. And Columbus, as a 
school which listens to children, where hall wander­
ing is undesirable but not a capital crime. However, at 
one point it whipped up a storm in a local paper and 
this, too, provided a useful teaching tool. Class after 
class talked over the controversy and their own feel­
ings about living and working together. These poems 
we called Walk Together Children. Every savable 
scrap of writing that emerged from all activities was 
stored for later publishing use. Poems written in Sep­
tember brightened a young author's eyes in April. 

Throughout the year children gained confidence 
from four hall bulletin boards which made their work 
visible. It was changed constantly, and students began 
to ask, "Who are you putting up now?" 

For some, especially the listless wanderers, the book 
was a turning point. Questioned about person or sub­
ject, they saw their spoken words written down into 
lines -of poetry. One poem is plagiarized but this tells 
an important story too. Apparently the young poet 
( whose work is already elsewhere in the book) felt his 
personal originality didn't measure up and in an indi­
rect way, by submitting a copied poem, he was saying, 
"Please help me learn how to do it better." 
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Berkeley's school hoard made the hook possible. In 
1969 it released $20,000 for mini-grants; money for 
special projects not provided for in the general budget. 
Any teacher could apply for a grant. Written requests 
were reviewed by a nine member teacher-administrator 
team and when our hook was printed, the grant pro­
vided a free copy for every child, cook, custodian, 
pfayground supervisor, teacher, and teacher aide at a 
total cost of 33¢ per person! 

Nicer yet, the day the hook came out, every child 
was reading. Stumbling through halls, on playgrounds, 
in class, children clung to their copies. {In one class 
members shook the hands of those poets in the hook.) 
Title and cover both came from contests; child-created, 
the winners were awarded artistic folktale hooks as 
prizes. 

Wringing further drops of pride from the project, 
four teachers teamed together and presented a pro­
gram called Young and Beautiful in Berkeley. Students 
recited selections for their parents and friends. We 
wasted no opportunity to put kids in a position to hear 
applause and praise. 

Recognition for extended teacher efforts ( which con­
sisted only in reshaping lines and lots and lots of 
typing) has been gratifying. Unexpectedly there has 
been press and TV coverage. Five of our youngsters 
read poems on a Huntley-Brinkley broadcast and oth­
ers appeared on a local morning show. The hook is to 
he displayed in an educational exhibit in Rome and 
letters have come to us from more that half the States. 

Another thousand copies are available at $1 plus 
postage, and the money is being placed in a special 
fund that will send children to camp this year. 

Teachers now have a natural teaching tool. Our kids 
know what a poem is and how a poetry line looks; the 
authors are their intimate friends and class copies are 
one more source of reading material. From Children 
With Love is tangible proof that in a school district 
that cares, children do grow. Eleven-year-old Deana 
Bradshaw summed it up well when she wrote: 
l have a dream 
A wonderful dream 
A dream that al.l 
The Black and White will 
Come together and be free 
And no violence will make 
This world a little better. 
It is the children who are showing the way! 

Rinna Wolfe 
256 Fairlawn Drive 
Berkeley, California 94708 
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What is a 
Frito eandilo,
Jose? 

Editor's Note: 

The power of the communications media to affect race 
relations has become increasingly apparent during the 
last decade. Much of the controversy over distortions 
of minority groups has centered about the black com­
munity hut other minorities have been equally dis­
quieted by the manner in which they, also, have been 
portrayed. 

The "Frito Bandito" character featured in a com­
mercial sponsored by Frito-Lay, Inc. has evoked the 
indignation of the Mexican American community. The 
Fall 1969 issue of the Civil Rights Digest carried an 
article by Thomas M. Martinez in which he cited the 
Frito Bandito caricature as an example of building a 
fallacious and harmful image of the Mexican Ameri­
can. 

Martinez wrote: "Seldom a day goes by in the 
United States without at least one young Mexican 
American being called 'Frito Bandito'. Indeed, this 
cartoon caricature of a short, mustachioed, two-gunned 
thief is a very effective prejudicial form of anti-locu­
tion-effective in terms of making the out-group ap­
pear inferior and the in-group superior. The Mexican 
American children are paying the price in loss of 
self-esteem for the Frito-Lay Corporation's successful 
advertising attempt at product association. To under­
stand how advertising can create such racial stereo­
types and inflame racism, we need to examine the 
functions of advertising in American society." 

The Spring 1970 issue of the Digest noted an article 
in the Wall Street Journal which reported that the 
Frito-Lay Company would retire the" Bandito''. Al­
though it has been modified, it has not been retired. 

The National G.I. Forum, an independent organiza­
tion of Mexican American veterans of this country's 
wars, conducted a 26-State survey during the summer 
of 1970 where its chapters are located and where large 
numbers of Mexican Americans live. Bernardo Sando­
val, its executive secretary, reported the survey re­
vealed an overwhelming disapproval of the''Bandito" 
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ad despite a past contention by Frito-Lay that its own 
survey .3howed reaction to the contrary. 

In a conversation with John R. McCarty, Frito-Lay, 
Inc.'s vice president for public relations, a Digest rep­
resentative received only background information and 
the intimation that anything said at this time might he 
prejudicial to the multimillion dollar suit which the 
Mexican-American Anti-Defamation League is threat• 
ening to bring against the company. 

The editorial view of the matter, consistently taken 
by Advertising Age and two letters in r.esponse to its 
position, are reprinted here for further information 
and perspective. 

The Frito Bandito Hassle 
For some time now a controversy has been swirling 

around the use of a little cartoon character named 
Frito Bandito in ads and commercials for Frito-Lay's 
corn chips. The Mexican-American Anti-Defamation 
Committee calls it degrading; the Frito-Lay people call 
the Bandito "cute and lovable.'' 

It would seem obvious that what might he "cute and 
lovable" to some people could be far from that to 
others. And apparently to at least part of the 
Mexican American community Frito Bandito is an of­
fensive stereotype of a Mexican, and they would like to 
see use of him in ads discontinued. 

Three TV stations, one in Los Angeles and two in 
San Francisco-areas whose populations include a 
goodly percentage of Mexican Americans-have 
heeded the requests of their viewers and have taken 
commercials with Frito Bandito in them off the air. A 
fourth California station has indicated it may do like­
wise. 

The Frito-Lay people have presented results of sur­
veys among Mexican Americans which show that only 
8% of the people queried objected to Frito Bandito. 
This, Frito-Lay maintains, is not enough of an objec­
tion, in its opinion, to remove the Bandito from their 
ads. Besides, the company points out, it has spent a lot 
of money developing the character, and it has been 
one of the company's most successful ad campaigns. 

Aside from questioning the wisdom of following an 
ad policy that alienates 8% of the Mexican American 
community, one wonders if Frito-Lay doesn't have a 
social responsibility when it comes to its advertising 
campaigns. Frito-Lay says it "talked to some minority 
organizations, hut not to Prof. Martinez" ( director of 

Mexican American seminars at Stanford University). 
Perhaps a talk with Prof. Martinez might prove en­
lightening. 

(Reprinted with permission from Jan. 11, 1971 issue of Advertis­
ing Age. Copyright© 1971 by Crain Communications, Inc.) 

Frito aandito Is still Around 
The Editorial Viewpoint 

Nearly two-and-a-half years have elapsed since a 
group named Involvement of the Mexican American in 
Gainful Endeavor wrote a letter to Frito-Lay, Inc. ask­
ing that company to remove from television commer­
cials featuring a cartoon character named "Frito Ban­
dito.'' In its letter the group raised the following objec­
tion to the commercials: "We feel they perpetuate the 
stereotyped Mexican image which is false and dis­
torted and is an injustice to the person of Mexican 
descent." 

Frito-Lay, when asked to comment on the letter, 
said, "Until we have time to properly study it and 
reply, we have no comment to make.'' But at the same 
time the company did announce that "because of the 
recent concern regarding violence in America" it was 
altering the commercials so that the Frito Bandito no 
longer would be seen firing a gun. 

The original protesting group was joined in subse­
quent months by other Mexican American groups, and 
finally in November 1969, 15 months after the first 
protest was lodged, KNBC-TV in Los Angeles banned 
the Frito Bandito spots from its station. After that two 
San Francisco stations-KRON and KPIX-followed 
suit. But there still was no indication from Frito-Lay 
that it had any intention of removing from the air alto• 
gether the spots that the Mexican American groups 
maintained were demeaning and offensive. 

Early in 1970 two U.S. Senators got into the act and 
wrote letters to several advertisers-including Frito­
Lay-agencies and networks calling on them to elimi­
nate demeaning characterizations of Mexicans from 
the airwaves. 

When the news of the Senators' letters got out Frito­
Lay finally was heard from; the company announced 
that Frito Bandito advertising would be replaced be­
cause of opposition to the cartoon character from "cer­
tain leaders of Mexican American organizations." 

That was nearly a year ago-February 1970-and 
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yet just last week the Mexican-American Anti-Defama­
tion Committee announced that the Frito Bandito com­
mercials still are being aired on TV as often as before, 
or perhaps even oftener, and said that it plans to rne 
the creators of Frito Bandito for $610,000,000. 

What a sorry state of affairs. Whether or not you 
happen to feel-we do-that these commercials are 
indeed demeaning, it is the foot-dragging of Frito-Lay 
that is inexcusable. Admittedly the company did not 
say exactly when it was going to replace the offending 
commercials-but when such a statement is made in 
February 1970, and the commercials still are appear­
ing ten months later, we don't think that speaks very 
well for the good faith of Frito-Lay. 

The company already has let this situation go too 
far. It is high time it lived up to the statement made 
last February and sees that Frito Bandito is replaced 
-right now. 

(Reprinted with perm1ss10n_ from Feb. 1 and 15. 1971 issues of 
Advertising Age. Copyright© 1971 by Crain Communications, Inc.) 

The Voice of the Advertiser 

Finds Frito Bandito Innocuous 
as Heckle & Jeckle 

To the Editor: Regarding your editorial on the 
Frito-Lay Co. in the Jan. 11 issue of Advertising Age­
I'm shocked that you would take the stand that you 
apparently have. 

Seldom have I seen such a ridiculous piece of phi­
_losophy as that piece of copy and the cause it supports. 
An y group who would be offended by a clever cartoon 
character such as the Frito Bandito deserves to be left 
sitting on their hands for nearly a year. I can't imag­
ine anyone taking personal offense at anything so ob­
viously generalized and non-personal. I'm positive that 
not even the precocious youth of today believes for a 
minute that all Mexican Americans look and act like 
Pancho Villa, and I definitely oppose the action that 
these people are taking to deliberately conceal the facts 
of their colorful ancestory, as well as the truths of 
history. 

Their protests are comparable to the Audubon So­
ciety protesting Heckle & Jeckle as national defamation 
of the magpie character ( or has the Audubon Society 
gotten around to that already?). Or like my refusing 

to acknowledge the legend of Davy Crockett-or pro­
testing the Daniel Boone TV show on the grounds that 
it defamed my character as an American. 

I'm disappointed in the American people for letting 
this sort of undemocratic creativity-stifling thing hap­
pen in a country that used to be free. And I'm un­
speakably contemptuous of the Mexican Americans (as 
I never was before) for being not only narrow-minded, 
but ashamed of a proud heritage. 

J. Philipps, 

Bunn Winter Associates, St. Louis. 

Backs AA, Says Chicanos 
Rightfully Resent 'Bandito' 

To the Editor: It appears that J. Philipps ( "Voice," 
Feb. 1) is easily shocked. This is surprising, since his 
letter suggests he may be insensitive to, or perhaps 
unaware of how deeply Americans of Mexican ances­
try-not members of some protest group-resent the 
Frito Bandito characterization that perpetuates a de­
meaning stereotype. 

Here in St. Louis we are comfortably insulated from 
the Chicano "problem." Mr. Philfpps would really be 
shocked to know how many Anglo-Americans in the 
Southwest, aside from precocious youths, believe that 
the bandito type is fairly representative of all Mexi­
cans. 

Advertising Age's position on this issue is absolutely 
right. A decent regard for the sensibilities of an of­
fended segment of our population is not only good 
business, it is a humane obligation. 

The charge that creativity is being stifled is ridicu­
lous. The Heckle and Jeckle comparison is not valid; 
birds are neither audience nor consumers. Using Davy 
Crockett and Daniel Boone for comparison is grossly 
unfair. They are seldom depicted as less than heroic. 
How could such exemplary types defame my 
character? 

The Mexican American is not ashamed of his proud 
heritage, he simply resents having his heritage dis­
torted. Mr.Philipps_would do better to save his con­
tempt for those of us who do the distorting, or who 
accept distortion. 

Blythe Baebler, 

Art Director, Batz Hodgson 
Neuwoehner, St. Louis. 
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The U.S. Commission on Civil Rights is a temporary, 
independent, bipartisan agency established by Con­
gress in 1957 and directed to: 

• Investigate complaints alleging that citizens are be­
ing deprived of their right to vote by reason of their 
race, color, religion, or national origin, or by reason 
of fraudulent practices: 

• Study and collect information concerning legal de-
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velopments constituting a denial of equal protection 
of the laws under the Constitution; 

• Appraise Federal laws and policies with respect to 
equal protection of the laws; 

• Submit reports, findings, and recommendations to 
the President and the Congress; and, 

• Serve as a national clearinghouse for civil rights 
information, 
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